Government SaskBuilds and Procurement
o SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
M Saskatchewan 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1

SALE SUMMARY LIST

SaskSurplus Sale #11

From Feb 7 to Feb 14, 2024

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as
described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles

and equipment are sold “AS IS, WHERE IS”, there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.

- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.
It is the Bidder’s responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.
Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.
Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,

- by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-787-2238,

- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or

- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.

WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller.
No Bid = Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.
2/26/2024,9:42 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.
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SaskSurplus,Vehicle and Equipment Sales
500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1

Item #

Description Kms

REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles

SaskSurplus Sale #11

From Feb 7 to Feb 14, 2024

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

Min Price Serial Number

Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.

$4,255.55

11-003

Car 2013 CHEVROLET Impala LS FWD 3.6L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 211,688
power mirrors/locks/windows/trunk release/left front seat, keyless entry 2 keys, 2 fobs, grey, km
TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed

by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser

assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in “As

is, where is” condition., 211,688 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Power steering rack leaking, left

lower ball joint, front struts, alignment, washer hose, hood chips, front bumper chips, rear

bumper chips/scrapes, right rear fender scratches, left front door rust inside bottom, roof

dent/rust, trunk lid scratches, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield cracked, passenger

mirror housing /glass broken, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

$2,230.00 2G1WA5E31D1188036

$3,889.89

11-001

Car 2013 CHEVROLET Impala LS FWD 3.6L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, 233,457
power mirrors/locks/windows/trunk release/left front seat, keyless entry 2-keys, 2 fobs, km
white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be
signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed.

Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is

sold in “As is, where is” condition., 233,457 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Check engine light

codes: P0446 Evap vent system, P0496 Evap system flow, P0300 random misfire, power

steering rack leaks, oil cooler lines leak, right front lower control arm bushing, needs parts for
alignment, grille upper broke, hood hail/chips, front bumper chips, left rear fender small rust
spots/road rash, left side doors rust at bottom in and out, right front door rust inside bottom,
dents out side A pillar and over top of door on right side and left side, roof hail, trunk lid hail,

no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield small chips, right front mirror housing broke, poor
battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

$1,616.00 2G1WA5E39D1249293

$11,755.00

11-004

Van 2012 FORD Transit Connect Cargo FWD 2.0L, Inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD 80,278 km
player, power heated mirrors/windows, defogger on rear cargo doors, keyless entry-2 key
fobs, 1 key step on rear bumper, cargo barrier, 2 shelves, bars on inside of rear cargo doors,
raised roof, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY
Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to
be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections.
This vehicle is sold in “As is, where is” condition., 80,278 km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Front
rotors, exhausted leak, brake covers, wiper blades, front bumper faded, rear bumper rusted,
roof brackets for roof rack no cross bars, hole in roof 3 sealed, small rust spot on roof, tailgate
rust spots, head lights fogged, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips/pitted, hole in
left front mat, poor battery, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is

$8,697.00 NMOLS6BN2CT088536

2/26/2024,9:42 AM

SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 2
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500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1

SaskSurplus Sale #11

From Feb 7 to Feb 14, 2024

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous Items and Equipment.
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.
$6.55 11-172 Amber Beacon, Whelan, L41 Series W3.1, 6" wire lead, with mounting bracket, unknown if $5.00
operational. Fair
$6.00 11-167 Auto Safety Kit, Canadian Tire brand. , Cone for flash light, 2 blankets, 1 poncho, 1 fabric $5.00
blanket, 1 triangle, 1 pliers, 1 Phillips screwdriver, 3 piece collapsible shovel, KIT AS IS. Fair
$35.55 11-162 Auto Safety Kit, SafeTGear, Carry case, safety marker, 12V compressor, poncho, gloves, $5.00
$10.00 11-163 Auto Safety Kit, Voyageur , Carry case, window/seat belt breaking tool, booster cables, $5.00
blanket, gloves, misc. items, extendable shovel, KIT-AS IS. Fair
$25.55 11-168 Auto Safety Kit, Voyageur brand. , Carry case, recovery strap, gloves, blanket, folding $5.00
shovel, miscellaneous items, may be mssing items, KIT AS IS. Fair
$12.76 11-169 Booster Cables, Nascar Advantage , 11 foot. Blue, has a carry case. Fair $5.00
$5.01 11-170 Booster Cables, , 11 foot, yellow. Fair $5.00
No Bid * 4-101 Box, metal, 20"w x 8"d x 16"h, grey, bolted to a removable metal base, hinged lid with a $1.00 171975
lock but no key. Fair
No Bid * 5-102 Box, metal, 20"w x 8"d x 16"h, grey, hinged lid, hole in lid, no lock. Fair $1.00
No Bid * 7-101 Box, metal, Grey, hinged lid with a hole, lock, no key, 20"w x 8"d x 16"h. Fair $1.00
No Bid * 7-102 Box, metal, Grey, hinged lid, no lock, 20"w x 8"d x 16"h. Fair $1.00
$42.00 11-101 Camera, Exakta Varex Jhagee Dresden VX, possibly from the early 1950's. Made in Germany. $20.00 725625
, Uses the old film type, not included, not digital, worn, some buttons may be seized,
unknown if operational. Fair
$222.22 11-102 Outboard Tiller, 15hp Johnson, Model CJ15RCUD - F, White and Black. Unknown if $1.00 C8216858
operational. Poor
$251.00 11-103 Outboard Tiller, 25hp Johnson, Model 25r79r-F , White, red and black, unknown if $1.00 C8036015
operational. Poor
$212.12 11-104 Outboard Tiller, 4.5hp Evinrude, Model ESRCSS - W, Grey, blue and red, with built in gas $1.00 C7081964
tank, unknown if operational. Fair
$121.21 11-105 Outboard Tiller, 4hp Mercury, Model Unknown - W, Black and blue, with built in gas tank, $1.00 7179556
unknown if functional. Fair
$121.21 11-106 Outboard Tiller, 6hp Evinrude, Model 6402C - W, Grey, white, red and blue, unknown if $1.00 C70048
operational. Poor
$121.21 11-107 Outboard Tiller, 6hp Johnson, Model 6r78b-W , White, red and black, unknown if $1.00 C8009784
operational. Poor
$121.21 11-108 Outboard Tiller, 9.8hp Mercury, Model Unknown-F , Black and red, unknown if operational. $1.00 7219957
Poor
$222.22 11-109 Outboard Tiller, 9.9hp Johnson, Model 10r77a-W , White, red and black, unknown if $1.00 30058
operational. Fair
2/26/2024,9:42 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 3
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SaskSurplus Sale #11

From Feb 7 to Feb 14, 2024

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
$15.00 11-164 Roadside Emergency Kit, Pacetap, Carry case, booster cables, recovery strap, reflective $5.00
triangle, hand pressing flash light, 2 - emergency blankets, gloves, extendable shovel, KIT AS
IS. Fair
$26.02 * 9-172 Tires, Set of 2 225/65R16, Artic Claw Winter TXI, Snow flake, M+S, Manufacture date. Week $20.00
24, year 2016. Poor
$221.51 11-157 Tires, Set of 4 225/55R17, Sailun Inspire, M+S , Manufacture date week 11, year 2022. Good $180.00
$222.00 11-158 Tires , Set of 4 225/60R16, Firestone Winterforce 2, Snowflake, M+S, Manufacture date week $180.00
05, year 2020. Excellent
$142.00 11-165 Tires, Set of 4 225/65R/16, Firestone All Season, M+S, Manufacture date, week 34, year $120.00
2021. Fair
$150.00 11-166 Tires, Set of 4 225/65R/17, Bridgestone Alenza A/S 02, M+S, Manufacture date, week 47, $120.00
year 2020. Fair
$212.00 11-159 Tires, Set of 4 235/65R17, Continental Cross Contact Rx, M+S, Manufacture date week 40, $160.00
year 2020. Good
$252.00 11-160 Tires, Set of 4 P215/50R17, Michelin Energy Saver A/S, M+S, Manufacture date week 42, $200.00
year 2020. Good
$111.00 11-161 Tires, Set of 4 P225/65R17, Michelin Latitude Tour, M+S, Manufacture date week 08, year $100.00
2015. Fair
$527.00 11-171 Tires, Set of 5 255/70R17, General Grabber HTS, M+S, Manufacture date. Week 29, year $250.00
2023. Excellent
$733.33 11-148 Trailer, 1981, Brandt, Reel, Hydraulic is seized, no deck, no spool, pintle hitch size 3", tire $250.00 36507
size 12.00R20, GVW unknown. Needs a jackall jack to lift the hitch for hook up. Good
$4,711.95 11-149 Trailer, 1998 Trail Tech , Tandem, flatbed with metal grid, wooden brace at front of trailer, $250.00 2CU116JA8W200373
dimensions, 25.6'd x 8.7'w x 4.5'h, 3" pintle, GVWR 8,000lbs, ST205/75R15 tire size. Good
*WD 11-173 Triangle Warning Kit, Grote, 71422 , 17" triangle, 3 triangles per kit, comes with storage $20.00
case. Good
*WD 11-174 Triangle Warning Kit, Grote, 71422 , 17" triangle, 3 triangles per kit, comes with storage $20.00
case. Good
*WD 11-175 Triangle Warning Kit, Grote, 71422 , 17" triangle, 3 triangles per kit, comes with storage $20.00
case. Good
*WD 11-176 Triangle Warning Kit, James King + Co. model 1005 , 17" triangle, 3 triangles per kit, comes $20.00
with storage case. Good
$5.00 * 10-117 Chairs , Lot of 5 5 casters, plastic and foam, Swivel, tilter, adjustable, green, floral print, minor $1.00
scuffs and scratches from wear and tear Good
$5.00 * 10-118 Chairs , Lot of 5 5 casters, plastic and foam, Swivel, tilter, adjustable, green, floral print, minor $1.00
scuffs and scratches from wear and tear Good
2/26/2024,9:42 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.
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SaskSurplus Sale #11

From Feb 7 to Feb 14, 2024

Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306
Fax: 306-787-2092

Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
$50.00 * 10-119 Chairs , Lot of 5 5 casters, plastic and foam, Swivel, tilter, adjustable, green, floral print, minor $1.00
scuffs and scratches from wear and tear Good
$5.00 * 10-120 Chairs , Lot of 5 5 casters, plastic and foam, Swivel, tilter, adjustable, green, floral print, minor $1.00
scuffs and scratches from wear and tear Good
$2.51 11-177 Fax, Desktop, Brother IntelliFAX 2820, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing, $1.00 U63274D7)420276
AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$1.03 11-178 Fax, Desktop, Brother IntelliFAX 2820, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing, $1.00 U63274M7J530031
AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$3.35 11-179 Fax, Desktop, Brother IntelliFAX 2840, Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing, $1.00 U63274C3J361598
AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$100.00 * 3-132 File Cabinet, Lateral, metal, 36"w x 18"d x 52.5"h, 4-drawer, dents and scratches from ware $20.00
and tear, lockable with no key, grey. Fair
$3.50 11-110 Printer, Desktop MFP, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet M2727NF All-In-One , Operational (powers $1.00 CNG8C6GM7Z
on, no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included.
Fair
$25.00 11-180 Printer, Desktop MFP, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet M2727NF All-In-One , Operational (powers $1.00 CN895GSDW
on, no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included.
Fair
No Bid 11-181 Printer, Desktop MFP, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro 400 M425DN, Operational (powers on, $1.00 CND8F4VO0ZF
no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$1.00 11-182 Printer, Desktop MFP, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro 400 M425DN, Operational (powers on, $1.00 CNF8G446K8
no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$1.20 11-111 Printer, Desktop MFP, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M1536 DNF , Operational (powers on, $1.00 CNF8F7C6Z4
no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-183 Printer, Desktop MFP, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M225DN , Operational (powers on, no $1.00 CNB9H892BZ
noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$35.55 11-112 Printer, Desktop MFP, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M227 FDN , Operational (powers on, no $1.00 VNB3T00517
noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$35.55 11-184 Printer, Desktop MFP, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M227 FDN , Operational (powers on, no $1.00 VNB3J26890
noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$55.80 11-113 Printer, Desktop MFP, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M477FDN Color, Operational (powers $1.00 VNBSHDR7KH
on, no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included.
Fair
2/26/2024,9:42 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 5
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SaskSurplus Sale #11

From Feb 7 to Feb 14, 2024
Closing Time: 10:00 A.M. Sask. Time
Phone: 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306

Fax: 306-787-2092

Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
$3.00 11-185 Printer, Desktop MFP, Hewlett-Packard Officelet 8600 Pro, Operational (powers on, no $1.00 CN29SBS1MZ
noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$7.00 11-186 Printer, Desktop MFP, HP Color Laserlet Managed MFP E47528f, Operational (powers on, no $1.00 CNCRQ3VOYD
noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$5.00 11-187 Printer, Desktop, Brother MFC-9130CW Laser Multifunction Centre , Operational (powers on, $1.00 U6347414)546330
no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$5.00 11-188 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Color LaserJet CP1215, Operational (powers on, no $1.00 CNBC8B80QQ
noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$6.00 11-189 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Color LaserJet CP4025DN, Operational (powers on, no $1.00 JPBCC6G6L7
noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$17.20 11-190 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Color Laserjet Managed E45028dn, Operational (powers $1.00 VND3P05270
on, no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included.
Fair
$1.03 11-114 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 1012, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNFB650241
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid * 9-114 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 1020, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNBK743295
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-115 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4000N, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 USEF204014
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-191 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4050TN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 USQC068243
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-192 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4050TN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 USQF067731
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-116 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4100TN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 USBNH02049
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-117 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4200DN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNBX218227
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-193 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4200DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 USGNX17755
further testing, AS IS), damaged, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$1.00 * 9-115 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4200DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 USDNN17770
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, small part broken off on top at back, wiped/reset,
power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-194 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4200DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 USDNM15263
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
2/26/2024,9:42 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.
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Item # Description Kms Min Price Serial Number
No Bid 11-195 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4200DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 USDNX06808
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$1.00 * 9-116 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4200DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 USDNP13325
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-118 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4250DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNRXK38679
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-196 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4250DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNGXB31776
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-197 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4250DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNGXD29390
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$1.00 * 9-117 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4250DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNBXC38918
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$1.00 * 9-118 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4250DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNGXF40914
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$1.00 * 9-119 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4250DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 USBXP16768
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-119 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4250TN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNGXJ09727
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-120 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4250TN , Operational (powers on, noisy startup, $1.00 CNBXB02496
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-121 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4350DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNGXF38088
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-122 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4350DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNRXH62089
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-198 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4350DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNBX502399
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-199 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4350DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNRXS45648
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-200 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4350DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 USBXN13902
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$3.35 * 8-178 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4350DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNRXB92843
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$1.00 * 9-120 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4350DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNBXD20575
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$1.00 * 9-121 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4350DTN, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNRXB97981
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-123 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4350TN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNRXK45592
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
2/26/2024,9:42 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.
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$5.00 11-124 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4350TN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNRXY01572
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$3.35 * 8-179 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4350TN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNRXB86421
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$3.35 11-125 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet 4350TN, Operational (powers on, noisy startup, $1.00 CNGXH25780
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$3.35 11-126 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet 4350TN, Operational (powers on, noisy startup, $1.00 CNRXK95231
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$3.35 11-201 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise 600 M602X , Operational (powers on, $1.00 CNDCG801GS8
no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid * 9-122 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise 600 M602X , Operational (powers on, $1.00 CNCCDCFOX1
no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid * 9-123 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise 600 M602X , Operational (powers on, $1.00 CNCCF122C6
no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid * 9-124 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise 600 M602X , Operational (powers on, $1.00 CNCCG2ROXW
no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid * 9-125 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise 600 M602X , Operational (powers on, $1.00 CNDCG801G7
no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-202 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet P1505, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 VND3B76698
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-203 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P1606DN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 VNB3D57102
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, paper catcher broken/loose, wiped/reset, power cord
included. Fair
$3.30 11-127 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P1606DN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 VNB3G40001
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$5.00 11-128 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P1606DN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 VND3G25020
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$3.30 11-147 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P1606DN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 VND3C41572
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$3.30 11-204 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P1606DN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 VNB3B78127
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$3.30 11-205 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P1606DN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 VNB3J05380
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
2/26/2024,9:42 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.
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$3.30 11-206 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P1606DN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 VNB3N73247
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

$3.30 11-207 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P1606DN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 VND3F52315
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

$3.30 11-208 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P1606DN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 VND3F95933
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

$3.30 11-209 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P1606DN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 VND3G32143
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

$3.35 11-129 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet P2055dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNB9760578
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

$3.35 11-130 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P2055dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNBJ503927
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

$3.35 11-210 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet P2055dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNBJ574898
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

$3.35 11-211 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet P2055dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 VNB3516981
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

No Bid * 9-128 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet P2055dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNB9M26275

further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

$3.35 11-131 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P4015X, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNDY259353
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

$21.00 11-212 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P4015X, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNDY199205

further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

$1.00 11-213 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P4015X, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNDY263085
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

$3.35 11-214 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P4015X, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNDY294123
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

$3.35 11-215 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P4015X, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNDYB57034
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

$3.35 11-216 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P4015X, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNDYC21997
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

$3.35 11-217 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P4015X, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CNDYC37032
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

$5.00 11-218 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro 200 M251nw , Operational (powers on, no $1.00 VNB3C01539
noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, damaged, missing a front panel,
wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

$5.00 11-219 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro 200 M251nw , Operational (powers on, no $1.00 CNB1G09455
noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

2/26/2024,9:42 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.
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No Bid 11-132 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro 400 Printer M401dne , Operational (powers $1.00 PHGFG05824
on, no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included.
Fair
$5.00 * 9-134 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro 400 Printer M401dne , Operational (powers $1.00 PHGFC25248
on, no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included.
Fair
$1.25 11-133 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M201DW , Operational (powers on, no $1.00 VNB3C26058
noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included, missing
paper tray extender. Fair
$1.25 11-134 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M201DW , Operational (powers on, no $1.00 VNB3C42846
noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$1.25 11-135 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M201DW , Operational (powers on, no $1.00 VNB3F40960
noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$1.25 11-220 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M201DW , Operational (powers on, no $1.00 VNB3F31464
noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-221 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M201DW , Operational (powers on, no $1.00 VNB3F40948
noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$25.00 11-222 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M201DW , Operational (powers on, no $1.00 VNB3F40963
noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$12.55 11-136 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M203dw , Operational (powers on, no noises, $1.00 VNB3B26123
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$12.55 11-137 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M203dw , Operational (powers on, no noises, $1.00 VNB3B91648
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$12.55 11-138 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M203dw , Operational (powers on, no noises, $1.00 VNB5D75885
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$12.55 11-223 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M203dw , Operational (powers on, no noises, $1.00 VNB5D16744
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$12.55 11-224 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M203dw , Operational (powers on, no noises, $1.00 VNB5D22881
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$3.35 11-139 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M401dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, $1.00 JPDFH00043
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$3.55 * 9-138 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M401dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, $1.00 VNB3N02684
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$3.55 * 9-140 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M401dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, $1.00 VNG4X16891
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-140 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Pro M402dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, $1.00 PHBQC07263
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$20.00 11-141 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M402dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, $1.00 PHBQF99949
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
2/26/2024,9:42 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.
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$5.00 11-225 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M402dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, $1.00 PHBQC14129
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-226 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M402dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, $1.00 PHBQD01855
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-227 Printer , Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M402dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, $1.00 PHBQD79134
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-228 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M402dn, Operational (powers on, no noises, $1.00 PHBQF83180
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$25.00 11-229 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M452dw , Operational (powers on, no noises, $1.00 VND3D00905
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$12.00 11-232 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M452dw , Operational (powers on, no noises, $1.00 VNB3P37945
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$16.00 11-230 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M454dw , Operational (powers on, no noises, $1.00 VNB3D27278
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$27.00 11-231 Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Pro M454dw , Operational (powers on, no noises, $1.00 VNB3L00853
no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$12.50 * 8-156 Printer, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 9050DN , Floor model printer with wheels, operational $1.00 JPRL8C3080
(powers on, no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord
inchided Fair
$20.00 * 8-160 Printer, Large Desktop Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise M651 DN, Operational (powers $1.00 JPCCJ2KOGN
on, no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included.
Eair
$6.75 11-142 Printer, Large Desktop MFP, Hewlett-Packard Laserlet Enterprise 500 MFP M575 , $1.00 MXFCGBQOXK
Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset,
power cord included. Fair
$6.75 11-233 Printer, Large Desktop MFP, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet M3035XS , Operational (powers on, $1.00 CNQCB17186
no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$6.75 11-143 Printer, Large Desktop MFP, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet M3035XS MFP, Operational (powers $1.00 CNQCB80952
on, no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included.
Eair
NoBid 11-144 Printer, Large Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Color LaserJet CP4025DN, Operational (powers on, $1.00 JPDCFOMONF
no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
2/26/2024,9:42 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.
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$15.01 11-234 Printer, Large Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Color LaserJet CP4025DN, Operational (powers on, $1.00 JPBCC6G6LI
no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$8.00 11-235 Printer, Large Desktop, Hewlett-Packard Color LaserJet CP4025DN, Operational (powers on, $1.00 JPDCF1X16C
no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$6.75 11-145 Printer, Large Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4200DTN, Operational (powers on, no $1.00 USBNL0O8776
noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$6.75 11-236 Printer, Large Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 4350DTN, Operational (powers on, no $1.00 CNRXL41587
noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid * 9-143 Printer, Large Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 9050DN , Operational (powers on, no $1.00 JPRCC5Q04M
noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$6.75 11-237 Printer, Large Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise 600 M602X , Operational $1.00 CNCCF840FS
(powers on, no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord
included. Fair
$12.55 11-238 Printer, Portable, Hewlett-Packard Officelet 250 Mobile All in One Printer , Operational $1.00 TH77B5813F

(powers on, no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord
included. Printer shows a "Carriage Jam" error, but there is no paper or other obstruction
evident, Fair

$12.50 * 6-166

Printer , Floor-model, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 9050N , With wheels, operational (powers
on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair

$1.00 JPRL86K006

No Bid * 5-165 Printer , Large Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet Enterprise M651DN, Operational (powers $1.00 JPCCH2L149
on, no noises, no further testing), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-239 Scanner, Flatbed, Hewlett-Packard Scanjet 7500, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 SG581110080619
further testing, AS IS), damaged, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
$26.00 11-240 Scanner, Flatbed, Hewlett-Packard Scanjet 7500, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 SG5811100J0619
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair
No Bid 11-146 Scanner, Hewlett-Packard Scanjet Pro 2500 F1, Operational (powers on, no noises, no $1.00 CN8CAA10C3
further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, no power cord. Fair
$106.00 11-150 Sit/Stand Desk , Actiforce, Steelcase, Pepperdust/black, 3 motorized legs, button panel, 70"w $10.00
x 23"d x adjustable height, return side 70"w x 23"d x adjustable height, unknown if
operational, minor scuffs and scratches from wear and tear. Good
$106.00 11-151 Sit/Stand Desk , Actiforce, Steelcase, Pepperdust/black, 3 motorized legs, button panel, 70"w $10.00
x 23"d x adjustable height, return side 70"w x 23"d x adjustable height, unknown if
$115.00 11-152 Sit/Stand Desk , Actiforce, Steelcase , Pepperdust/black, 3 motorized legs, button panel, 70"w $10.00
x 23"d x adjustable height, return side 70"w x 23"d x adjustable height, unknown if
$161.00 11-153 Sit/Stand Desk , Actiforce, Steelcase, Pepperdust/black, 3 motorized legs, button panel, 70"w $10.00
x 23"d x adjustable height, return side 70"w x 23"d x adjustable height, unknown if
2/26/2024,9:42 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.
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$166.00 11-154 Sit/Stand Desk , Actiforce, Steelcase , Pepperdust/black, 3 motorized legs, button panel, 70"w $10.00

x 23"d x adjustable height, return side 70"w x 23"d x adjustable height, unknown if

operational, minor scuffs and scratches from wear and tear. Good
$101.00 11-155 Sit/Stand Desk , Actiforce, Steelcase , Pepperdust/black, 3 motorized legs, button panel, 70"w $10.00

x 23"d x adjustable height, return side 70"w x 23"d x adjustable height, unknown if

operational, minor scuffs and scratches from wear and tear. Good
$106.00 11-156 Sit/Stand Desk , Actiforce, Steelcase , Pepperdust/black, 3 motorized legs, button panel, 70"w $10.00

x 23"d x adjustable height, return side 70"w x 23"d x adjustable height, unknown if
operational, minor scuffs and scratches from wear and tear. Good

2/26/2024,9:42 AM
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BLACKSTRAP PROVINCIAL PARK, Call for Directions
Contact Sean Antoniuk 306 371-1616, sean.antoniuk@gov.sk.ca or Jaime Provo 306-290-7285, jaime.provo@gov.sk.ca
$10,051.75 11-544 T-Bars, Lot of 31 Borer, Ski lift attachments. Fair $1.00
DOUGLAS PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks Culture and Sport, PO Box 39, Elbow SK
Contact Sherry Harpham, 306-854-6266, sherry.harpham@gov.sk.ca
$836.00 11-525 Car 2004 DODGE Intrepid SE FWD 2.7L, V6, gas auto air, AM/FM, gold, TOW ONLY, NO SGlI 251,848 $500.00 2C3HH46R24H634926
Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI km
Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 251,848
km, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Does not start with boost, will not turn over, one tire is flat, battery
in poor condition, motor, transmission, brakes and exhaust all condition unknown., As is,
Where ig
$7,234.00 11-523 Loader 1998 NEW HOLLAND 545D unknown 3.1L, 3 cylinder, diesel 4 speed torque converter 2039 hrs $1,000.00 602 98989
a fan in the roof on the tractor unknown, yellow, , 2039 hrs, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Cab roof
has been raised and extended, compromising (roll over protection system) ROPS and safety
guidelines, tires, battery, exterior, windshield washer, wipers and interior all in poor
condition, motor, transmission, brakes, exhaust and lights all condition unknown., As is,
Where ig
$9,566.13 11-524 Loader 1998 NEW HOLLAND 545D unknown 3.1L, 3 cylinder, diesel 4 speed torque converter a 1830 hrs $1,000.00 602 98984
fan in the roof on the tractor. This tractor comes with a bucket. bucket attachment/ forks,
yellow, , 1830 hrs, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Tires, battery, exterior, interior, windshield washer
and wipers all in poor condition, motor, transmission, brakes, exhaust and lights all condition
unknown_ Asis Where is
MEADOW LAKE Provincial Park, Parks, Culture & Sport, Dorintosh
Contact Rick Gollings 306-240-5041, rick.gollings@gov.sk.ca
$11,521.11 11-526 Tractor 2013 DUETZ-ALLIS 7145 FWA diesel standard 16 speed AM/FM 707 Leon loader and 5064.44 $1,500.00 76433286
bucket, tire size 20.8-38B and 16.9-28F, green, , 5064.44 hrs, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Lightson  hrs
the fenders are broken, hydraulics are slow, tires in poor condition., As is, Where is
MOOSE JAW, Highways & Infrastructure, Fleet Services, 1 km south of Moose Jaw on Hwy #2
Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, allan.froehlich@gov.sk.ca or Tara Watson 306-694-3773, tara.watson@gov.sk.ca
$477.00 11-541 Gearbox, Dodge, TXT425BT, BTV Taper bush, Operational. Excellent $50.00
$14,451.80 11-527 Loader 1995 KOMATSU WA-120 4WD 410T/240T, inline 4, diesel 3 speed Powershift single 3998 hrs $2,500.00 20211
tire, tire size 445/80R25, load range U, yellow, , 3998 hrs, , KNOWN PROBLEMS: Front right
turn signal broken, horn doesn’t work, rear wiper motor only works on high, motor fair/runs,
transmission fair/works, good tires/brakes, poor body exterior/paint/interior, fair
battery/exhaust/windshield glass/ windshield washers & wipers/lights/mirrors.>, As is, Where
1S
$112.00 11-542 Machine Shop Supplies, Assorted, 1 box bolts, 2 wiring rolls, 2 boxes of roll pins and pop $1.00
rivets, 1 box of various sized plastic storage boxes, all used. Fair
2/26/2024,9:42 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 14
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PRINCE ALBERT, Corrections Policing & Public Safety, 3021 - 1st Ave W
Contact Don Balan 306 953-3000, donald.balan@gov.sk.ca or Dean Schmalz dean.schmalz@gov.sk.ca
$3.00 * 8-550 Container, Lot of 9 stainless steel, 9"w x5"d x6"h, 1 gallon. Poor $1.00
PRINCE ALBERT, Corrections Policing & Public Safety, 901 7th Ave NE
Contact Robert Beauchesne 306-953-3168, robert.beauchesne@gov.sk.ca or Tricia Hrynenko 306-953-2661, tricia.hrynenko2@gov.sk.ca
$226.00 * 10-513 Doors, Lot of 18 Steel, 35"w x 2"d x 84"h, 14 with windows and 4 without windows, have $90.00
hardware, some have in built locks but no keys. Good
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, PO Box 5005
Contact Keri Roles, 306-930-8305, krolles2@gov.sk.ca or Duane Barlow (306)953-3409, Duane.Barlow@gov.sk.ca
$3.00 * 10-501 Cell Phone, Motorola, Old analog cell phone, wiped, no chargers, unknown if operational. $1.00 SIUG2376AE
Fair
$3.00 * 10-502 Cell Phone , Samsung GT, Old analog cell phone, wiped, no chargers, unknown if operational. $1.00 R31C80F7DLY
Poor
$31.31 * 10-503 File Cabinet, 3 drawer, legal size, lateral, 36"w x 19"d x 41"h, beige color, no key. Good $1.00
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Ave N
Contact Suzanne Goota 306-953-3417, suzanne.goota2@gov.sk.ca or Karla Ens 306-953-3416, Karla.ens@gov.sk.ca
$161.66 11-501 Chest Waders, Lot of 8 Acton Canada, Protecto Chest A4287-11 , Size-12 Men, black, $50.00
neoprene, CSA 1, natural rubber. Exellent
$202.22 11-502 Chest Waders, Lot of 10 Acton Canada, Protecto Chest A4287-11 , Size-13 Men, black, $50.00
neoprene, CSA 1, natural rubber. Exellent
$564.91 11-503 Topper, Brand FX, fiber, Black, 8'length, no keys, originally came from Chev/GMC and has $50.00 04 6642
been used in Ford & Dodge. Fair
$486.67 11-504 Topper, Brand FX, fiber, White, 8' length, no keys, originally came from Chev/GMC and has $50.00 06 13578
been used in Ford & Dodge. Fair
$537.64 11-505 Topper, Fiber, metal, White, 8' length, no keys, originally came from Chev/GMC and has $50.00
been used in Ford & Dodge. Fair
$377.77 11-506 Zodiac Boat, Barrett Marketing Group, Titan-AL 370, Rubber, 66"w x 144", 8 person, $100.00 34997
capacity 1452 Ib/660 kg, white, two small holes in the nose and one of the air valves has a
slight leak. Fair
REGINA, Immigration and Career Training, 10th Floor, 2103 - 11th Ave
Contact Kayla Swicheniuk 306-787-5014 kayla.swicheniuk@gov.sk.ca or Verna Ziegler 306-787-2580 Verna.Ziegler@gov.sk.ca
$20.00 * 9-537 File cabinet, 2 doors, vertical, 42"w x 14"d x 36"h, 3 shelves. Good $5.00
$7.00 11-518 File Cabinet, Metal, 3 drawer, lateral, 36"w x 18"d x 39"h, beige, no key. Fair $5.00
$100.00 11-519 File Cabinet, Metal, 3 drawer, lateral, 36"w x 18"d x 39.5"h,beige, key included. Fair $5.00
$100.00 11-520 File Cabinet, Metal, 3 drawer, lateral, 36"w x 19"d x 40.5"h, beige, no key. Fair $5.00
No Bid 11-521 Office Chair, Fabric, plastic, Blue/black, with armrest, 5 casters. Fair $5.00
$10.00 11-543 Swiss Balls , Lot of 2 , Black Mountain Products- 85 cm, black; TheraGear -55cm, pink, weight $5.00
limit 2200 |bs. Fair
2/26/2024,9:42 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.
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REGINA, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, 300 1870 Albert St
Contact Waneta Hardy 306-798-0312, waneta.hardy@gov.sk.ca
$1.80 * 8-665 Table, Metal, 27.5"w x 24"d x 30"h, 2 shelves, with wheels, beige. Fair $1.00
REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority, 1702 Park St
Contact Kristen Nelson 306-787-0179, knelson@slga.com or Tyrone Smith 306-787-1934, tsmith1@slga.com
$10.00 11-528 Chairs , Lot of 2 Fabric, wooden frame , Blue, with armrest and legs. Good $1.00
$25.00 11-529 Chairs , Lot of 2 Fabric, wooden frame , Green, with armrest and legs. Fair $1.00
$20.00 11-530 Chairs , Lot of 2 Fabric, wooden frame, Light maroon, with armrest and legs. Fair $1.00
$3.86 11-531 Chairs, Lot of 2 Steel, vinyl, Black/silver, no arms. Fair $1.00
$25.00 11-532 Desk, Laminate, metal, rectangular, 72"w x 36"d x 30"h, 3 drawers at right side. Fair $1.00
$5.25 11-533 File Cabinet, Metal, 3 drawer, lateral, Grey, no key, 15"w x23"d x27.25"h. Fair $1.00
$15.00 11-534 File cabinet, Metal, 3 drawer, lateral , Beige, no key, 36"w x19.25"d x41"h. Fair $1.00
$25.00 11-535 File cabinet, Metal, 4 drawer, lateral, Beige, no key, 36"w x18"d x 52"h. Fair $1.00
$45.00 11-536 File cabinet, Metal, 4 drawer, lateral , Beige, with key, 36"w x19.25"d x 53"h. Fair $1.00
$3.33 11-537 File Cabinet, Pedestal, 3 drawer, lateral, Pepperdust, no key, 18"w x 24.5"d x27.25"h. Good $1.00
$53.00 11-538 File Cabinet, Pedestal, 3 drawer, lateral, Pepperdust, with key, 18"w x 24.5"d x 27.25"h. $1.00
Good
$8.12 11-539 File Cabinet, Pedestal, 3 drawer, lateral, Pepperdust, with key, 18"w x 24.5"d x 27.25"h. Fair $1.00
$5.00 11-540 Table, Laminate, metal, rectangular, 48"w x 30"d x29.5"h. Fair $1.00

SASKATOON, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, SCC, 910 60th St. E

Contact Renee Pound 306-956-8817, renee.pound@gov.sk.ca or Danielle Corriveau 306-956-8869 danielle.corriveau@gov.sk.ca.

$10.51 * 9-560 Continuity and Relay Tester, IBM, metal/plastic, Black/grey, comes in a box, approx 6"w x $1.00
3"d, unknown if operational. Fair

No Bid * 9-562 DVD Case, Lot of 2 plastic, 120 Verbatim DVD's, 4.7 GB, 120 minute, 16xspeed and 7 Maxell $1.00

$78.75 * 6-561 Grating, steel, oxide primer, Some used, 1"w x 1/8" thick, assorted sizes, 24" x 36", 48" x $1.00
36", 12" x 36", 12" x 120". Good

No Bid * 9-565 Keyboard Tray, metal, 20"w x 11"d, black, pull out style. Fair $1.00

No Bid * 9-566 Keyboard Tray, metal, 27"w x 10 1/2"d, mounting arm 21 1/2" length, pull out style. Fair $1.00

$55.88 * 9-550 Propane Storage Cabinet , Lot of 2 metal, Each cabinets 35 1/4"w x 32 1/2"d x 36 1/4"h, does $1.00
not have doors. Good

2/26/2024,9:42 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.
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$55.88 * 9-551 Propane storage cabinet, Lot of 2 metal, Each cabinets 35 1/4"w x 32 1/2"d x 36 1/4"h, does $1.00
not have doors. Good
$55.88 * 9-552 Propane storage cabinet, Lot of 2 metal, Each cabinets 35 1/4"w x 32 1/2"d x 36 1/4"h, does $1.00
not have doors. Good
$329.97 * 5-521 Sheet Metal , Lot of 3 steel , 48"w x 120"d x 11ga, perforated, 1/4" holes. Good $1.00
$439.96 * 5-522 Sheet Metal , Lot of 4 steel , 48"w x 120"d x 11ga, perforated, 3/16" holes. Good $1.00
$219.98 * 5-523 Sheet Metal , Lot of 2 steel , 48"w x 120"d x 11ga, perforated, 3/8" holes. Good $1.00
$1.75 * 9-570 Tampon Vending Machine , B-3500, stainless, 15 1/8"w x 4"d x 25 1/2"h, operational. New- $1.00
Unused
No Bid * 9-571 Telephone Accessories , Approx Lot of 10 plastic , Black/white/grey, assorted plug ins, $1.00
telephone and handset cords. Fair
No Bid * 9-572 Universal Modular Amplifier, Plantronics Vista, M12, Black, unknown if operational. Fair $1.00
SASKATOON, Saskatchewan Research Council, 143-111 Research Dr
Contact Roger Dauvin 306-385-4035, roger.dauvin@src.sk.ca or purchasing@src.sk.ca
$150.00 11-508 8 pH Controllers and 13 Probes, Lot of 20 PinPoint, 1 pH controllers does not work properly, $1.00
others were operational when last used. Includes a pH probe to monitor and regulate the pH
in a sample. Fair
$414.32 11-509 Assorted Recirculators, Actuators and Pumps , Lot of 13 3 Belimo LF230 US Fail-Safe Actuators, $1.00
4 Aqualogic Elecre Recirculators and 6 Little Giant Pump Co. Water Pumps, Operational when
last used. Fair
$227.77 11-510 Custom Manifold , 10 regulators and 10 solenoids, 100"w x 18.25"d x 36"h, regulator 44.5"h, $1.00
regulators dispense CO2 at a regulated pressure, and solenoid control dispensing of CO2 gas,
operational when last used. Fair
$250.00 11-511 Heat Pump, Delta Star, FAO08745, metal , 20.25"w x 23"d x 15"h, black, compatible for $1.00
home aquariums, research and laboratory and aquaculture, operational when last used. Fair
$138.11 11-512 Sink Drain System Pumps , Lot of 2 Goulds Water Technology, SD51C , Approx 16"dia x 16"h, $1.00
blue/black, operational when last used. Fair
$75.96 11-513 Tank, 250L, rectangular, 48.25"W x 18.25"d x 22"h, green, includes 3 screen meshes. Fair $1.00
$165.73 11-514 Tank, 400L, rectangular, 51"w x 27"d x 21"h, green. Fair $1.00
$243.00 11-515 Tanks , Lot of 3 420L, rectangular, PVC, 100.25"w x 28"d x 11.5"h, on PVC stands. Fair $1.00
$138.11 11-516 Tanks , Lot of 2 250L, cylindrical, plastic, metal , 38.5"h with 30" inner dia and 32.05" outer $1.00
dia, with drainage platform. Used to maintain culture of fish. Fair
$822.33 11-517 Tanks with brackets and frames , Lot of 4 500L, plastic, steel, Approx 58"w x 28.5"d x 61.25"h, $1.00
8 frames, 16 brackets - 29.25" long, 4 steel frames-27.25"w x 59"h, 2 used for bleached waste
water and 2 used to store clean dechlorinated water. Fair
2/26/2024,9:42 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received.
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SPIRITWOOD, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, 116 1st St. E
Contact Brendon Smith 306 883 8513, Brendon.smith@gov.sk.ca or Jason Reddekopp 306 883 8505, jason.reddekopp@gov.sk.ca
$86.00 11-507 Trail Cameras , Lot of 3 Moultrie - MCG-12783 and MCG-12635, Wildgame Innovations - $1.00 127831412006414,

W3ECAN , Operational, camo in colour, no batteries or cable or charger included. Good 126351407009479,

WEYBURN, Highways, Maintenance Yard, 18 Souris Ave

Contact Chris Dunne 306-535-8056, chris.dunne@gov.sk.ca

$21,557.00 11-522 Loader 2000 CASE 621C 4WD 6T-590 Cummins, inline 6, diesel standard tilt 4 speed forward, 3 4567.7 hrs $5,000.00 JEE0122915

reverse, single tire, tire size, 20.5-25, yellow, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if
any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed.
Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required., 4567.7 hrs, , PROBLEMS: Engine
access panels heavily corroded and rusted, area on the top of back window where wiper
mounts is heavily corroded, tires are weather cracked between treads but sidewalls are ok,
front hydraulic cylinder appears to be leaking, cab corners heavily corroded, left seat has some
rips/tears, interior door panel torn and foam exposed, windshield rust stained, battery is in
poor condition., As is, Where is

2/26/2024,9:42 AM SaskBuilds and Procurement reserves the right to reject any or all offers to purchase/bids received. 18



