

## **SALE SUMMARY LIST**

**PLEASE NOTE:** Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold “AS IS, WHERE IS”, there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit [www.SaskSurplus.ca](http://www.SaskSurplus.ca) for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with \* have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on [www.SaskSurplus.ca](http://www.SaskSurplus.ca) web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from [www.SaskSurplus.ca](http://www.SaskSurplus.ca) or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-787-2238,
- by email to [sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca](mailto:sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca), or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

**MT = (Ministry Transfer)** This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.

**WD = (Withdrawn)** This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller.

**No Bid =** Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles</b>				
<b>Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.</b>				
<b>\$5,026.99</b>	<b>1-005</b>	Car 2012 DODGE Avenger SE FWD 2.4L, Inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry, 2 key fobs , blue, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 207,270 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: No plate light assembly, tires/brakes fair, poor battery. KNOWN PROBLEMS: Hood dents/paint peeling/scratches, front bumper chips/faded, rear bumper scratches, left front fender scratches, rocker panel road rash/rust, left rear and right-side doors rust/road rash, right front door scratches, trunk lid scratches/some rust, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips/scratches, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	207,270	\$3,566 1C3CDZAB9CN213630
<b>\$5,026.99</b>	<b>1-006</b>	Truck 2014 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 RWD, Double Cab, 7'9" Box 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry, 1 key, 1 fob wig wags front/rear right mirror, grille inserts, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, jump seat loose in back seat, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 299,878 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Left upper/left lower ball joints, right inner/right outer tie rod, rear pads/rotors, needs alignment, missing washer reservoir cap, front bumper, no plate light, tires poor, poor battery. KNOWN PROBLEMS: Hood hole drilled, front bumper chips/dents, rear bumper covered in paint, left rear fender dents at rear, right rear fender rust/chips, left front door chips, 1 hole in roof sealed, antenna, tailgate scratches/dents, multiple holes drilled in box floor, holes drilled in floor boards, paint splashed on interior/exterior, front of box dented, spare tire needs to be replaced loose in box may not be compatible with unit, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, seat worn/foam visible, front lower valance cut out, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	299,878	\$4,996 1GCRCEC6EZ271867

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>No Bid</b> 1-017	Truck 2015 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 4WD, Crew Cab, 6'7" Box 5.L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, computer stand, power windows/locks/mirrors, keyless entry 2 keys, 2 fobs grille inserts, front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, headache rack with beacon, "Lo Pro" tonneau cover-fair condition, box liner, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 318,636 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Right outer tie rod ends, alignment needed, tires poor, missing washer reservoir cap, poor battery. KNOWN PROBLEMS: Hood scratches/hail, front bumper pitted, rear bumper bent/scratches, left front fender scuffs, left rear fender rust/chips, left front door dent/scratch, right front door rust at bottom/interior soiled front door sills, rear doors paint peeling, roof hail/dented, tailgate badly damaged, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat worn/foam visible/soiled, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	318,636 km	\$6,949	3GCUKPEC8FG208574
<b>\$8,000.00</b> 1-018	Truck 2015 DODGE Ram 2500 4WD, Crew Cab, 6'4" Box 5.7L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, power heated mirrors, power windows/locks, keyless entry, 2 key fobs grille inserts, front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, spare tire tools laying in back seat, has back seat, blue, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 153,753 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Power steering leak-pump, transmission poor (poor shifting/fibers in trans oil), upper and lower ball joints right side, alignment needed, rear tires poor, poor battery. KNOWN PROBLEMS: Grille loose, hood chips/scratches, front bumper rust spots, rear bumper rusted/bent, all fenders road rash/scratches, both rocker panels road rash, left front door scratches, left rear door hole/scratches/dent, right side doors road rash/scratches, roof scratches/silicone on roof, 1 hole in rood sealed, tailgate dented/missing molding, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield cracked, seat worn/padding visible, missing jump seat, holes in floor, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	153,753 km	\$6,177	3C6TR5CT8FG674849

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
\$19,777.77 1-007	Truck 2012 DODGE Ram 5500 SLT 4WD, Crew Cab, Brand FX Service Body 6.7L, Inline 6, diesel auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, heated power trailer tow mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry 2 key fobs, 9 other keys, 2-hand held remotes grille inserts, front tow hooks, mud flaps, trailer wiring, pintle hook, OEM trailer brakes, HD rear deck, Altec model AT237, condition unknown, man lift condition unknown, dual tire, FX service body 6 compartment, aluminum cabinets condition fair, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 216,784 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Left rear calipers seized, both upper/lower control arm bushing worn, both upper ball joints loose, front brakes questionable, all wheel studs badly rusted, all rotors badly rusted, rear brakes at 0mm, windshield washer not working, poor battery. KNOWN PROBLEMS: Altec model AT237 aerial device rusty, hood chips/dents, rear bumper left side bent/broken, rocker panels rusted, left side doors rusted/chips, right front door bent/top of window frame bent, right rear door rusted, roof rust stains, wheel wrench/jack missing, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher/wheel chocks, windshield cracked, left front seat cover ripped, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	216,784 km	\$18,995	3C7WDNEL2CG174685
No Bid 1-009	Truck 2003 FORD F550 RWD, Regular Cab, General Service Body 6.0L, V8, diesel auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 1 key, 5 other keys dual rear wheels, front tow hooks, side steps, trailer tow mirrors, mud flaps, HD rear bumper, trailer wiring, 2" receiver, electric trailer brake, service body-2 beacons and 3 panel sliding top, Cobra max lift crane 3305W 12V, 2 out rigger legs condition unknown, general service body 8 compartments fair condition, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 402,877 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Left manifold broken, engine oil leaks, steady bearing, battery light comes on, dash losing power, intermittent stalling whole driving, rear brake cables, right front mud flap, tires fair. KNOWN PROBLEMS: grille broken, front bumper faded, left and right front fenders chips/road rash/rust, left and right front doors rusted/chips, roof rusted, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield cracked, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	402,877 km	\$6,944	1FDAF56P63EC72074

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>\$12,678.08</b> 1-010	<p>Van 2006 CHEVROLET Express 3500 Cargo RWD 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, rear aux heater, AM/FM, power locks, 3 keys plus 2 other keys map box, lid damaged, cargo barrier, 2 shelves, plywood floor, ladder on rear door, HD rear bumper, pintle hook, trailer wiring, trailer brake, generator compartment on left side, Warwick ladder with beacons, side light, step ladder mounting brackets on left side condition of unit unknown, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 132,490 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Engine light on, left rear brake not releasing, air bag light on, poor battery.</p> <p>KNOWN PROBLEMS: hood poor paint/dents, front bumper rusted, left front door paint peeling, right front door paint peeling, right rear door rust, rocker panel rust, left front and right side doors paint peeling, hole in roof 2 sealed, tailgate right rear dents/weather stripping loose, wheel wrench missing, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left mirror glass cracked, left seat badly worn, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, Where is</p>	132,490	\$9,523	1GCHG35U361243381
<b>\$10,189.89</b> 1-011	<p>Van 2007 CHEVROLET Express 3500 Cargo RWD 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, aux heater, power locks, 2 keys, 1 other key map box, computer stand, cargo barrier, plywood floor, 2 shelving units, ladder rack with beacon-condition unknown, hitch, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, mud flaps, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 113,186 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Pit arm loose, idler arm loose, both rear calipers sliding pins seized, left rear exhaust manifold mount bolt missing, exhaust leak at flange in front of muffler (mount bolts broken), A/C belt cracked, poor battery.</p> <p>KNOWN PROBLEMS: Hood chips, front bumper rust, rear bumper rust/scratches, left and right front fender paint peeling, left and right rear fenders rusted, rocker panels rusted, left front door paint peeling, right side doors paint peeling/dents, weather strips falling off rear door, roof paint poor/rust, hole in roof 7 sealed, tailgate weather stripping/door very stiff, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, left front seat sagging, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, Where is</p>	113,186	\$5,805	1GCHG35UX71233416

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>\$7,300.00</b> 1-012	<p>Van 2007 CHEVROLET Express 3500 Cargo RWD 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, rear aux heated, power locks, 3 OEM keys, 1 other key mud flaps, hitch, with pintle hook, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, 1 shelf, cargo barrier, map box ladder rack, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 86,875 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Pitman arm and idler arm loose, A/C belt cracked, park brake not working, front tires not matched/needs alignment, sliding door does not latch properly, high mount brake light, air bag light on, right wiper blade missing, poor battery.</p> <p>KNOWN PROBLEMS: Grille cracked, hood paint peeling/chips, both bumpers' rusted/bent/dented, left front fender paint peeling, left rear fender rusted, right rear fender rusted/dented, both rocker panels rusted, left side door sill rusted, right side doors paint peeling, roof paint peeling, 2 holes in roof sealed, tailgate lift will not open, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, seat worn/foam sagging/visible, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, Where is</p>	86,875 km	\$4,012	1GCHG35U871233320
<b>\$10,189.89</b> 1-013	<p>Van 2012 CHEVROLET Express 3500 Cargo RWD 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power front windows/locks, keyless entry, 1 fob, 2 keys, 2 other keys mud flaps, pintle hook-seized, HD rear bumper, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, cargo barrier, 1 shelf, 1 cabinet with work counter, plywood floor, port window left rear fender, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 70,757 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Pitman arm, idler arm and right outer tie rod end all loose, front/rear wheel alignment, pintle hitch seized left front marker light, poor battery.</p> <p>KNOWN PROBLEMS: Hood paint peeling, front bumper scratches/dents, left rear fender dent, right rear fender badly dented, right front door dent/paint peeling, right rear door badly dented/paint poor, hole in roof 1 sealed, tailgate dent, wheel wrench/jack missing, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat vinyl worn/seat sagging, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, Where is</p>	70,757 km	\$9,953	1GCZGTCG7C1130031

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>\$8,189.89</b> 1-001	Van 2012 CHEVROLET Express 3500 Cargo EXT RWD 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks/front windows, rear auxiliary heat, keyless entry 2 fobs, 2 keys, 2 other keys cargo barrier, plywood floor, shelving, cabinets, worktable, ladder rack with 2 storage compartments/beacon condition unknown, amber wig wags on rear of rack, HD rear bumper, trailer wiring, pintle hook, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 165,009 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Pitman arm, inner/outer tie rod ends loose, park brake, left rear caliper sliding pins seized brakes fair, wiper blades, license plate light, poor tires/battery. KNOWN PROBLEMS: Grille broke, hood paint peeling/dented, front bumper pitted/scratches/dented, left front fender paint peeling, left rear fender road rash/rust, right rear fender rust, left front door inside bottom rust, right rear door paint peeling, hole in roof 1 sealed, tailgate scratches/rust/dents, wheel wrench/jack missing, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, left front seat vinal cracked/sagging, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	165,009 km	\$7,461	1GCZGUCGXC1128974
<b>\$5,226.99</b> 1-014	Van 2009 DODGE Grand Caravan FWD 3.3L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, rear HVAC, power mirrors/locks/front windows, keyless entry, 2 key fobs 7 passenger, Stow-N-Go 3rd row seat only, silver, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 108,328 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Right front CV joint, left rear brake caliper leaks, cross over pipe, brakes fair, poor battery. KNOWN PROBLEMS: Hood paint bubbling/dents, both bumpers' chips/scratches, left front fender rust/hole, left side doors small rust spots at bottom, right side doors scratches, tailgate dents/chips/scratches, front valance hanging, right front door paint peeling around window frame, head lights fogged, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	108,328 km	\$2,132	2D8HN44E69R641529

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>\$5,678.08</b> 1-015	<p>Van 2002 GMC Savana 3500 Cargo RWD 6.5L, V8, diesel auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, rear aux heater, 3 keys, 2 remote fobs-condition unknown mud flaps, HD rear bumper with pintle hook, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, window left rear quarter panel, shelves, cargo barrier, countertop with cupboard, map box, ladder rack with beacon condition unknown, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 112,529 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Front shocks leaking, battery doesn't hold charge, left rear park brake not releasing, pintle hitch seized, right front park light not working.</p> <p>KNOWN PROBLEMS: Grille white paint splatter, front bumper dents/chips/scratches, left rear fender crease, rocker panels dented, right rear door scratches, left front door weather stripping loose, roof paint peeling/rust, 2 holes in roof sealed, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat worn/hole/frame visible, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, Where is</p>	112,529 km	\$2,381	1GTHG39F121210093
<b>\$3,616.00</b> 1-016	<p>Van 2004 GMC Savana 3500 Cargo RWD 6.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, 2 OEM keys, 2 other keys mud flaps, HD bumper, pintle hook-sized, trailer wiring, electric trailer brake, map box, cargo barrier, shelving, plywood floor, compressor compartment, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 181,973 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Left outer tie rod boot cut, left rear and right rear exhaust manifold bolts missing, change engine oil light on, windshield washer, idler arm loose, poor battery.</p> <p>KNOWN PROBLEMS: Hood paint poor, front bumper scrapes/rust/hole drilled, left rear fender rusted/paint poor, right front fender paint peeling, right side fenders rusted/dented/chips, right rear fender 110V receptacle loose, rocker panel rusted, front door sill rusted, left front door paint peeling/rusted inside/inside panel loose/window crank broke, right side doors chips/rust/paint poor, roof paint peeling/rust/rust stain, 4 holes sealed in roof, tailgate dented/rusted/chips, missing wheel wrench/jack, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield cracked/missing molding on top, left front seat poor condition/frame visible, minor exterior damage.&gt;, As is, Where is</p>	181,973 km	\$1,522	1GTHG35UX41226493



Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous</b>				
<b>Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.</b>				
\$303.33	1-118	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, non operational. Fair	\$250	GCAE-1426703
\$303.33	1-119	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, non operational. Fair	\$250	GCAE-1754863
\$303.33	1-120	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, non operational. Fair	\$250	GCAE-1960041
\$389.00	1-121	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, non operational. Fair	\$250	GCAE-2150110
\$303.33	1-122	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, non operational. Fair	\$250	GCAE-2154747
\$303.33	1-123	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, non operational. Fair	\$250	GCAE-2155066
\$303.33	1-124	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, non operational. Fair	\$250	GCAE-2155072
\$303.33	1-125	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, non operational. Fair	\$250	GCAE-2155079
\$303.33	1-126	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, non operational. Fair	\$250	GCAE-2484301
No Bid	1-117	Generator, Honda EM2500C , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good	\$500	GC02-6768987
\$500.00	1-127	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good	\$500	GCAE-1426694
\$502.00	1-128	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good	\$500	GCAE-1960033
No Bid	1-129	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good	\$500	GCAE-1960579
No Bid	1-130	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good	\$500	GCAE-1960582
No Bid	1-131	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good	\$500	GCAE-2150058
\$556.00	1-132	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good	\$500	GCAE-2441984
No Bid	1-133	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good	\$500	GCAE-2442013

	Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid	1-134	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good		\$500	GCAE-2442021
No Bid	1-135	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good		\$500	GCAE-2484295
No Bid	1-136	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good		\$500	GCAE-2484298
\$556.00	1-137	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good		\$500	GCAE-2484307
No Bid	1-138	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good		\$500	GCAE-2484314
\$301.00	1-115	Generator, Honda EM2500 , AC out 120V, two 15 A plugs, gas, non operational. Fair		\$250	GC02-5965470
\$303.00	1-116	Generator, Honda EM2500 , AC out 120V, two 15 A plugs, gas, non operational. Fair		\$250	GC02-5965495
\$551.00	1-139	Generator, Yamaha, EF2800I , One 21A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, non operational. Fair		\$250	7VU-1321977
\$526.00	1-140	Generator, Yamaha, EF2800I , One 21A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, non operational. Fair		\$250	7VU-1322077
No Bid	1-142	Riding Lawn Mower, 2004, John Deere 1445 , Front-mount mower 60", 4WD, 31.1 HP, yanmar 1204cc, diesel, transmission hydrostatic, 400 hours, front tires 23 x 10.50-12 NHS, rear tires 18 x 8.50-10 NHS. Known Problems: Front mount mower hydraulics not operational, rust/scratches/paint peeling, minor exterior damage.> Fair		\$10,000	TC1445D040814
No Bid	1-143	Riding Lawn Mower, 2007, John Deere 1445 , Front-mount mower 60", 4WD, 31.1 HP, yanmar 1204cc, diesel, transmission hydrostatic, 584 hours, front tires 23 x 10.50-12 NHS, rear tires 18 x 8.50-10 NHS. Known Problems: Rust/scratches/paint peeling, minor exterior damage.> Fair		\$10,000	TC1445D070358
No Bid	1-144	Riding Lawn Mower, 2007, John Deere 1445 , Front-mount mower 60", 4WD, 31.1 HP, yanmar 1204cc, diesel, transmission hydrostatic, 694 hours, front tires 23 x 10.50-12 NHS, rear tires 18 x 8.50-10 NHS. Known Problems: Right rear tire flat, rust/scratches/paint peeling, minor exterior damage.> Fair		\$10,000	TC1445D070325
No Bid	1-141	Riding Lawn Mower, 2004, John Deere 1445 , Front-mount mower 60", 4WD, 31.1 HP, yanmar 1204cc, diesel, transmission hydrostatic, 740 hours, front tires 23 x 10.50-12 NHS, rear tires 18 x 8.50-10 NHS. Known Problems: Rust/scratches/paint peeling, minor exterior damage.> Fair		\$10,000	TC1445D040810
No Bid	1-106	Rolling Cargo Bed, 3000 , Attached to 3/4" piece of plywood, with box on top, box, 40"w x 91"d x 13 3/4"h, bed 33"w x 87"d x 2 1/2"h. Fair		\$800	
\$12.25	1-107	Shelf, Steel , 2 level, top shelf 94"w x 12"d, bottom shelf, 96"w x 12"d, total heigh, 2'. Fair		\$10	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
\$35.00 1-114	Shelving , Galvanized steel , 6'w x 15"d x 4'h, plywood on 1 end, each area is 3' long. 1 area has 4 shelves 8" apart, second area has 1 shelf 3'2" h. Good		\$30	
\$110.00 * 12-113	Tires, Set of 3225/65R/17, Bridgestone Alenza A/S 02, M+S , Manufacture date. Week 46, year 2021. Good		\$100	
\$123.45 1-113	Tires, Set of 3 LT245/75R16, Kumon Power Grip KC11, Snowflake, M+S , Manufacture date. Week 20, year 2009. Fair		\$90	
No Bid 1-109	Tires, Set of 4215/60R16, Sumitomo Ice Edge, M+S, SF , Manufacture date. Week 17, year 2019. Fair		\$120	
\$328.88 * 12-102	Tires, Set of 4225/60R/16, Sumitomo HTR Enhance LX2, M+S , Manufacture date. Week 20, year 2019. Good		\$160	
\$308.88 1-110	Tires, Set of 4225/60R16, Firestone All Season M+S , Manufacture date. Week 25, year 2021. Good		\$160	
\$228.88 * 12-103	Tires, Set of 4225/65R/17, Goodyear Assurance Fuel Max, M+S , Manufacture date. Week 33, year 2017. Fair		\$120	
No Bid * 12-104	Tires, Set of 4225/65R/17, Sumitomo Encounter HT, M+S , Manufacture date. Week 35, year 2018. Fair		\$120	
\$407.00 1-111	Tires, Set of 4225/65R17, Firestone All Season M+S , Manufacture date. Week 41, year 2020. Good		\$160	
\$150.00 1-112	Tires, Set of 4225/65R17, Michelin Defender T+H, M+S , Manufacture date. Week 13, year 2019. Fair		\$120	
\$1,400.00 1-108	Topper, Leer, aluminum, wedge front , Shelf on left side, doors on both sides, front panel loose, has dents, tailgate has dents and broken molding, sides minor dents and scratches, does not have keys, with mounting clamps, comes with roof rack and beacon., 8'w x 68 1/2" d, may be compatible with a 2014 Dodge 2500, white. Fair		\$800	
\$8,276.00 1-146	Trailer, 2007, Saturn Industries , Tilt deck, GVW 12,000 lb, includes toolbox, pintle size 3", total length 273", deck 163"w x 78"d, dual axle, tire size ST235/80R16, comes with a spare tire. Fair		\$5,000	2S917B3247W010063
\$5,021.00 1-148	Trailer, 2007, Saturn Industries , Tilt deck, metal frame, wooden deck, GVW 12,000 lb, includes toolbox, pintle size 3", total length 271", deck 162.5"w x 78"d, dual axle, tire size LT235/80R16, comes with a spare tire ST235/80R16. Fair		\$5,000	2S917B3267W010064
\$5,309.00 1-147	Trailer, 2007, Saturn Industries , Tilt deck, metal frame, wooden deck, GVW 12,000 lb, includes toolbox, pintle size 3", total length 272", deck 169"w x 78"d, dual axle, tire size ST235/80R16, comes with a spare tire. Fair		\$5,000	2S917B3287W010065
\$6,106.00 1-149	Trailer, 2010, Mustang, ML-260X17 , Tilt deck, metal frame, wooden deck, GVW 12,000 lb, includes toolbox, pintle size 3", total length 284", deck 169"w x 80"d, dual axle, tire size ST235/80R16, comes with a spare tire. Fair		\$5,000	2M9FD6289B1142520

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
\$5,051.00 1-145	Trailer, 1997, Utility , Metal frame, wooden deck, metal ramp gate, GVW 12,000 lb, includes toolbox, pintle size 3", total length 270", deck 196"w x 72"d, dual axle, tire size LT235/88R16, no spare tire. Fair		\$5,000	2B9UD13C9UD127153
\$200.00 1-101	Desk, Steelcase , Assembled, main 63"w x 30"d x 30"h, L-side return 44"w 24"d x 30"h, desk comes with two drawers, two keys, modesty panels, surface tops and gables, scratches (wear and tear). Fair		\$20	
\$200.00 1-102	Desk, Steelcase , Disassembled, main 63"w x 30"d x 30"h, L-side unknown 44"w 24"d x 30"h, desk comes with two drawers no keys, modesty panels, surface tops and gables comes with instruction booklet, scratches (wear and tear). Fair		\$20	
No Bid 1-103	Desk, Steelcase , Disassembled, main 63"w x 30"d x 30"h, L-side unknown 44"w 24"d x 30"h, desk comes with two drawers no keys, modesty panels, surface tops and gables comes with instruction booklet, scratches (wear and tear). Fair		\$20	
\$29.99 1-104	Desk, Steelcase , Disassembled, main 63"w x 30"d x 30"h, L-side unknown 44"w 24"d x 30"h, desk comes with two drawers no keys, modesty panels, surface tops and gables comes with instruction booklet, scratches (wear and tear). Fair		\$20	
No Bid 1-105	Desk, Steelcase , Disassembled, main 63"w x 30"d x 30"h, L-side unknown 44"w 24"d x 30"h, desk comes with two drawers no keys, modesty panels, surface tops and gables comes with instruction booklet, scratches (wear and tear). Fair		\$20	
\$28.88 * 12-127	Desk, Steelcase , Disassembled, main 63"w x 30"d x 30"h, L-side unknown 44"w 24"d x 30"h, desk comes with two drawers no keys, modesty panels, surface tops and gables comes with instruction booklet. Fair		\$20	
\$5.00 * 11-203	Printer, Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet P1606DN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, paper catcher broken/loose, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair		\$1	VNB3D57102
No Bid * 9-143	Printer, Large Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 9050DN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair		\$1	JPRCC5Q04M

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>KINDERSLEY, Agriculture, Regional Services, 1120 - 608 12th Ave E.</b>				
<b>Contact Harpreet Kaur 306-463-5513, Harpreet.kaur@gov.sk.ca or Laine Radwell 306-430-8405, laine.radwell@gov.sk.ca</b>				
<b>No Bid * 12-512</b>	Chair, Fabric, metal , Black, no wheels & arms. Good		\$1	
<b>No Bid * 12-513</b>	Chair, Fabric, metal , Red/black/silver, no wheels, with arms. Good		\$1	
<b>No Bid * 12-514</b>	Hutch, Pepperdust , Approx. 63"w x 19"d x 43"h, 4 doors, 1 shelf. Good		\$1	
<b>MOOSE JAW, Highways, 1km South of Moose Jaw Hwy 2</b>				
<b>Contact Al Froehlich 306-694-3775, Allan.Froehlich@gov.sk.ca or Tara Watson 306-694-3773, tara.watson@gov.sk.ca</b>				
<b>\$57.00 1-520</b>	Hardware , Assorted , 1 pallet, miscellaneous. Excellent		\$10	
<b>\$55.00 1-521</b>	Hardware , Assorted , 1 pallet, miscellaneous. Excellent		\$10	
<b>\$75.00 1-522</b>	Hardware , Assorted , 1 pallet, miscellaneous. Excellent		\$10	
<b>\$55.00 1-523</b>	Hardware , Assorted , 1 pallet, miscellaneous. Excellent		\$10	
<b>\$20.00 1-531</b>	Shelving Unit, Metal , 123"w x 30"d x 48"h Fair		\$5	
<b>\$700.00 1-530</b>	Welder , 2003, ESAB, Multimaster 260 , 10A/12V-300A/30V, 60Hz, poor cables(frayed or cut), live short when unplugged, current seems to fluctuate at times. Poor		\$100	J322501
<b>NORTH BATTLEFORD, Highways 502 114th St</b>				
<b>Contact Mark Eisenkirch 306-526-9103, mark.eisenkirch@gov.sk.ca</b>				
<b>\$6,250.00 1-519</b>	Welder, 2008 Miller Bobcat 225 , Volts 120/240, KW 9.5, phase 1, Hertz 60, 55.8 hrs, operational. Good		\$500	LJ011382H
<b>OUTLOOK, Agriculture, 410 Saskatchewan Ave W</b>				
<b>Contact Janice Bennett 306-867-5527, janice.bennett@gov.sk.ca</b>				
<b>\$6,767.67 1-529</b>	Trailer, 2009, FOREST RIVER Transport Enclosed , 20', ball hitch hook up, operational. white As is, Where is		\$4,000	
<b>OUTLOOK, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, 420 Saskatchewan Ave</b>				
<b>Contact Scott Andrew 306-420-6427, scott.andrew@gov.sk.ca</b>				
<b>\$527.50 1-518</b>	Boat, 1984 Lund Pike P16D, Aluminum , 16' length, no motor or trailer, 2 seats, capacity 609kg, side console with QuickSilver controls, includes Lowrance sonar (unknown if operational). Poor		\$1	ZLU02081B585-L
<b>No Bid * 12-536</b>	Reciprocating Saw, DeWalt DC385 18V , Includes case, battery charger, battery; battery does not take charge, unknown if operational. Poor		\$1	264702

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>PRINCE ALBERT, SaskBuilds and Procurement, 1751 6th Ave</b>				
<b>Contact Mitchell Bieker 306-940-7845, mitchell.bieker@gov.sk.ca or Darren Whitehead, darren.whitehead@gov.sk.ca</b>				
\$1,088.88	1-528	Forklift, Raymond, Reach, electric, 20R30TT , Stand on with charger, charger is not wired in, unknown if operational. Fair	\$100	208p050
<b>PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Ave</b>				
<b>Contact Alan Carswell 306-953-2423, alan.carswell@gov.sk.ca or Tammy McGunigal 306-953-2422, tammy.mcgunigal@gov.sk.ca</b>				
No Bid	1-503	Air Purifier, Honeywell Power Alimentation , Operational, unknown if cleans air. Fair	\$1	
\$11.00	1-504	Projector Screen, Quartet , 99" w x 8' l, wall mount, operational. Fair	\$1	
\$10.00	1-505	VHS TV VCR combo, Panasonic , 20", unknown if operational. Fair	\$1	C9AA21121
\$2.25	1-506	Video Recorder, Canon HD HG10 , Includes battery, power adapter, remote & 3 cords, no SD card, problem holding charge, operational. Poor	\$1	672710500420
<b>PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 530 18th St. E</b>				
<b>Contact Gary Hembruch 306-960-2317, gary.hembruch@gov.sk.ca or John Alexandersen 306-960-9510, john.alexandersen@gov.sk.ca</b>				
\$52.50	1-501	Security Cameras, Pelco ES4036-2N, PTZ , Have EPP power supplies, unknown if operational. Fair	\$20	ADE-CGQ1 w/ADD-VR46, ADE-XST8 w/ADE-W086, ADE-XSU1
<b>REGINA, Agriculture, 1610 Park St</b>				
<b>Contact James Bush 306-798-0100, james.bush@gov.sk.ca</b>				
No Bid	1-502	Autopipetting Robot, Tecan Computer Controlled Liquid Handling Robot , 42" x 41" x 44". This needs software to function, and software is on a flash drive that is included. There is no training manual, but usually Tecan would come out and train users on it. There is no risk to sell to public. Operational. Good	\$55,000	
<b>REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor &amp; Gaming Authority, SLGA Distribution Center: GTH, 12252 Ewing Ave</b>				
<b>Contact Todd Leurer 306-510-4368, tleurer@slga.com or Darren Latimer 306-520-7891, dlatimer@slga.com</b>				
\$101.00 *	12-528	Growlers and Howlers, Glass , 2412 bottles, 32oz howlers, 12 bottles per case, 1200, bottles, 64oz growlers, 6 bottles per case, no lids included. Excellent	\$50	
<b>REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority, 1702 Park St</b>				
<b>Contact Kristen Nelson 306-787-0179, knelson@slga.com or Tyrone Smith 306-787-1934, tsmith1@slga.com</b>				
No Bid *	12-539	Chairs, Lot of 2Fabric, wooden frame , Aqua, with armrests and legs. Fair	\$5	
No Bid *	12-540	Chairs, Lot of 2Fabric, wooden frame , Blue, with armrests and legs. Good	\$5	
No Bid *	12-542	Chairs, Lot of 3Fabric, wooden frame , Green, with armrests and legs. Good	\$5	
\$10.50 *	12-549	File Cabinet, Metal, 3 drawer, lateral , Beige, with key, 15"w x 23"d x 27.5"h. Fair	\$5	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
\$7.50 * 12-555	Shelf/Cart, Wooden , 24"w x 20.5"d x26"h, 2 tier, 4 swivel casters. Fair		\$5	
<b>ROWAN'S RAVINE Provincial Park, Parks Culture and Sport, Call for Directions</b>				
<b>Contact Nathan Hafner 306-725-5200, nathan.hafner@gov.sk.ca</b>				
\$826.00 1-526	Truck 2008 CHEVROLET Colorado 4WD, Extended Cab 3.7 L, V6, gas auto Single axle, single tire, tire size P235/75R15, 2 ply, white, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 255161, KNOWN PROBLEMS: transmission slight hesitation, does not start needs new starter and battery, windshield 1 chip, motor/body exterior/exhaust/paint/interior used condition, tires poor.>, As is, Where is	255,161	\$100	1GCDT29E688224602
\$566.58 1-527	Van 2007 DODGE Caravan 2WD 3.3 L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, power windows, locks single axle, single tire, tire size P215/70R15, 2 ply, blue, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. , 282,384 km, KNOWN PROBLEMS: Back bumper damage, needs new drivers side wiper/washer, motor, transmission, battery, body exterior, exhaust, paint, interior all in used condition .>, As is, Where is	282,384 km	\$500	1D4GP25E47B206949
<b>SASKATOON, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, SCC, 910 60th St. E</b>				
<b>Contact Renee Pound 306-956-8817, renee.pound@gov.sk.ca or Danielle Corriveau 306-956-8869 danielle.corriveau@gov.sk.ca.</b>				
\$17.00 * 9-562	DVD Case, Lot of 2plastic , 120 Verbatim DVD's, 4.7 GB, 120 minute, 16xspeed and 7 Maxell Standard cases, includes 13 plastic cases. Good		\$1	
\$16.00 1-509	GPS, Garmin Nuvi1350 , Ultra thin GPS navigator with lane assist and spoken street names, operational. Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 9-565	Keyboard Tray, metal , 20"w x 11"d, black, pull out style. Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 9-566	Keyboard Tray, metal , 27"w x 10 1/2"d, mounting arm 21 1/2" length, pull out style. Fair		\$1	
\$6.00 1-510	Ladder, Aluminum , 68"h, with adjustment knob, missing pads on two legs. Poor		\$1	
No Bid 1-511	Locker, Metal , 1 red double - 24"w x 19 1/2"d x 72"h; 1 red single - two doors, 12"w x 18"d x 72"h and 1 red single locker 12"w x 19 1/2"d x 72"h, locks not included. Fair		\$1	
No Bid 1-512	Locker, Metal , 1 grey single - 12"w x 17 5/8"d x 72"h, locks not included. Fair		\$1	
\$20.00 1-513	Locker, Metal , 36 1/8"w x 19 1/2"d x 72"h, red, 1 tier, 3 door, locks not included. Fair		\$1	
No Bid 1-514	Locker, Metal , 36"w x 21"d x 72"h, blue, 1 tier, 3 door, locks not included. Fair		\$1	
No Bid 1-515	Storage Container, Plastic , 29 1/2"w x 13"d x 28 1/2"h, white, on casters. Fair		\$1	



Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>No Bid * 9-571</b>	Telephone Accessories, Approx Lot of 10 plastic , Black/white/grey, assorted plug ins, telephone and handset cords. Fair		\$1	
<b>No Bid * 9-572</b>	Universal Modular Amplifier, Plantronics Vista, M12 , Black, unknown if operational. Fair		\$1	
<b>SASKATOON, Highways 125 105th St E</b>				
<b>Contact Richard Liebel 306-933-5262, richard.leibel@gov.sk.ca</b>				
<b>\$107.77 1-516</b>	Welder, Lincoln, IDEALARC TM 300/300 , 575V, 43.5 AMPS, 60 cycles, operational but plugs from power cables have been removed & not included. Fair		\$1	69035
<b>\$107.77 1-517</b>	Welder, Lincoln, IDEALARC TM 400/400 , 575V, 58 AMPS, 60 cycles, operational but plugs from power cables have been removed & not included. Fair		\$1	69041
<b>SASKATOON, Saskatchewan Polytechnic 1130 Idyllwild Dr N</b>				
<b>Contact Chris Perry 306-659-4126, perrychr@saskpolytech.ca</b>				
<b>\$3,785.00 1-507</b>	Lathe, 1990, Nardini-MS 1440 E, Metal , 32" w X 80" d X 48" h, comes with tooling and instruction manual, green, operational, assistance may be provided for moving the item out of the building, customer will be responsible for all other loading and hauling. Good		\$700	C6HJX506
<b>\$11,000.00 1-508</b>	Press Brake , 2007, DurmaPress CNC, HAP 2560 , 1780 mm w x 3500 mm d x 2200 mm h, comes with tooling and instruction manual, operational, assistance may be provided for moving the item out of the building, customer will be responsible for all other loading and hauling. Good		\$7,000	7023076921
<b>YORKTON Highways, 245 York Rd E</b>				
<b>Contact Brian Perih 306-786-1651, brian.perih@gov.sk.ca or Ed Patzwald 306-786-1687, ed.patzwald@gov.sk.ca</b>				
<b>\$206.00 1-525</b>	Snap-On Tools, Assorted , One tool bag, one 3/8" impact; one 3/4" impact, three 18 volt high output batteries, two Lithium/Ni-Cad batteries, two 1/4" screwdrivers, one battery charger, three batteries 7.2 volt Ni/CAD, one rechargeable LED work light, one, flashlight, all tools operational, some batteries don't hold a charge. Poor		\$25	CT4418, CTB4187, CTC620, CTS561CL, CTB5172, CTC572, CTLED566, CTLED566A
<b>\$27.77 1-524</b>	Starter, Delco Remt 31003773-39MT , 12 volt, 12 tooth, silver, operational. Good		\$25	22398223



Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
<b>CANDLE LAKE, Parks, Culture and Sports, PCS, Box 119 S0J 2J0</b>				
<b>Contact Richard Monseler 306-929-8407, richard.monseler@gov.sk.ca or Janelle Franc 306-929-8401, janelle.franc@gov.sk.ca</b>				
\$280.99	1-532	Boat, Crestliner, aluminum , 12', with 2 benches, does not have a plug, unknown if any leaks. Poor	\$1	94741
\$150.99	1-533	Boat, Avon sport 5300, rubber boat , Unknown if operational. Poor	\$1	3549
\$245.25	1-534	Buzz Saw, Wisconsin TJD, portable , Unknown if operational. Poor	\$1	5320529
\$62.00	1-535	Carbon Filter, Anthracite 33625054L8M001 , 36 x 72, max pressure 150 PSI, max temp. 50C / 122F. Fair	\$1	
\$76.87	1-536	Cement Mixer, Monarch , On wheels but must be towed, unknown if operational. Poor	\$1	5240321 Serm #SCK7051
\$322.15	1-537	Drill Press, Rockwell Series No. 150-85 , 15V, 7.5 amp, 1 phase, operational. Fair	\$1	G29306, 13-07-37
\$82.00	1-538	Filter, Lot of 2 Mix Media, CH33414, CH34216 , 30 x 72, tank capacity 187, empty, operational. Fair	\$1	13915001, 22513002
\$86.00	1-539	Iron Filter, Lot of 4Vimridge , 125 Psi, unknown if operational. Fair	\$1	
\$350.00	1-540	Man Lift, Ballymore , Maximum capacity 1000lb, operational. Fair	\$300	
\$44.44	1-541	Pressure Washer, Karchur , 2400 PSI, 2.5 GPM, unknown if operational. Broken Repairable	\$1	
\$44.44	1-542	Pressure Washer, Karcher GC 150 with Honda 5.0 engine , 2800 PSI, unknown if operational. Broken Repairable	\$1	100969
\$1,653.53	1-543	Trailer, 2010, TrailTech, , Tandem, 16ft, tires are poor, 2 5/16" hitch, possible frame issue Fair	\$500	2CU138LA9A2027762
\$2,019.99	1-544	Trailer, 2000, Trailtech , Tandem, 20ft beavertail, 2 5/16" hitch, possible frame issue, tires are poor. Poor	\$500	2CU116GA4Y2006994
\$288.00	1-545	Wood Chipper, Olathe, with hitch, Model 12 , PTO driven, unknown if operational. Poor	\$1	12-120-956-HOD
<b>REGINA, Immigration and Career Training, 10th Floor, 2103 - 11th Avenue</b>				
<b>Contact Kayla Swicheniuk 306-787-5014 kayla.swicheniuk@gov.sk.ca or Verna Ziegler 306-787-2580 Verna.Ziegler@gov.sk.ca</b>				
\$5.50	12-520	File Cabinet, HON, metal, 3 drawer, lateral , 36"w x 19"d x 41"h, beige, no key. Fair	\$5	
\$5.50	12-521	File Cabinet, HON, metal, 3 drawer, lateral , 36"w x 19"d x 41"h, beige, no key. Fair	\$5	