

SALE SUMMARY LIST

PLEASE NOTE: Every effort has been made to accurately describe items and their condition; however, additional problems may exist, items may not be complete or exactly as described. Bidders are deemed to have reviewed the Terms and Conditions on bid forms and relied entirely on their own inspection and evaluation prior to bidding. Vehicles and equipment are sold "AS IS, WHERE IS", there is no implied or express warranty.

Visit www.SaskSurplus.ca for pictures and link to download Bid Form.

- Items identified with * have been on a previous sale and will be listed first on www.SaskSurplus.ca web site.
- SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, reserves right to have unadvertised minimum selling prices on items.

It is the Bidder's responsibility to review the terms and conditions of sale on the Offer to Purchase, Bid Form.

Bid Forms are available from www.SaskSurplus.ca or from the SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK.

Bid Forms can be submitted in the following ways:

- by deposit in the bid box at the SaskSurplus Sales Lot,
- by fax to 306-787-2092; by phone 306-787-2062 or 306-787-2238,
- by email to sasksurplus@gov.sk.ca, or
- by mail, addressed to: Ministry of SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus, 500 McLeod Street, Regina, SK S4N 4Y1.

(If mailing your bid, please allow sufficient time for bid to be received.)

- Bids received after close date and time cannot be accepted.

MT = (Ministry Transfer) This means that the item has been claimed by another ministry and automatically transferred to the ministry.

WD = (Withdrawn) This can happen if the item was requested to be removed by the seller.

No Bid = Items that did not receive any bids are normally carried forward to the next sale or may be withdrawn.

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Vehicles				
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.				
5,162.50	2-005	Car 2013 DODGE Avenger SE FWD 2.4L, Inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry 2 key fobs , blue, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 180,143 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Drive belt, front struts, front links, alignment needed, wiper blades, front lower splash shield missing under carriage damage both inner fenders broken, poor battery. KNOWN PROBLEMS: Hood paint bubbling, front bumper chips/scratches, rocker panels road rash/rust, all door rust at bottom/road rash, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	180,143 km	1C3CDZAB7DN604518
			\$3,955	
4,177.77	2-003	Car 2011 DODGE Avenger SXT FWD 2.4L, inline 4, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power mirrors/locks/windows, keyless entry 2 key fobs , silver, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 214,665 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: All pads/rotors, surface rust all over, wiper blades, headlights fogged, gas cap door does not close completely, poor battery. KNOWN PROBLEMS: Hood paint peeling/scratches, both bumpers' chips/scratches, left front fender scratches, left side doors rusted/scratches, right front door rusted, right rear door rusted/scrapes, trunk lid rusted, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield small chips, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	214,665 km	1B3BD4FB8BN510956
			\$1,608	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
3,131.00 2-001	Truck 2009 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 2WD, Extended Cab, 6'6" Box 5.3L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM/CD player, power locks, keyless entry 2 fobs, 2 keys grille inserts, hitch, trailer wiring, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 206,926 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Check engine/TPMS light on (codes: P2272 H2O bank sensor, P3400 cylinder deactivation, P106 map sensor, P0172 fuel trim bank 1, P0175 fuel trim bank 2), front pads/rotors, needs 4 new tires, poor battery. KNOWN PROBLEMS: Hood hail/chips, front bumper chips, rear bumper dent, left rear fender rust/dents, right rear fender rust, left side doors road rash, right side doors road rash/paint chipping off, 1 hole in roof sealed, tailgate chips/scratches/dents, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat worn/ripped/foam visible, holes drilled into box rails/dents, front of box dented, holes drilled in front hump, wheel chocks missing, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	206,926 km	\$2,594	1GCEC190X9Z240137
No Bid * 1-017	Truck 2015 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 4WD, Crew Cab, 6'7" Box 5.L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, computer stand, power windows/locks/mirrors, keyless entry 2 keys, 2 fobs grille inserts, front tow hooks, side steps, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, headache rack with beacon, "Lo Pro" tonneau cover-fair condition, box liner, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 318,636 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Right outer tie rod ends, alignment needed, tires poor, missing washer reservoir cap, poor battery. KNOWN PROBLEMS: Hood scratches/hail, front bumper pitted, rear bumper bent/scratches, left front fender scuffs, left rear fender rust/chips, left front door dent/scratch, right front door rust at bottom/interior soiled front door sills, rear doors paint peeling, roof hail/dented, tailgate badly damaged, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat worn/foam visible/soiled, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	318,636 km	\$6,949	3GCUKPEC8FG208574

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
6,898.00 2-006	Truck 2015 CHEVROLET Silverado 1500 4WD, Crew Cab, 6'6" Box 4.3L, V6, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power windows/mirrors/locks, keyless entry 2 key fobs, 2 keys wig wags front/rear/signal bar with switch, condition unknown, Lo-Pro tonneau cover, fair, box liner, grille inserts, front tow hooks, running boards, mud flaps, hitch, trailer wiring, OEM trailer brakes, headache rack with beacon, has back seat, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 327,357 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Left inner tie rod, all four tires, alignment needed, right backup/left plate light, poor battery. KNOWN PROBLEMS: Both bumpers scratches/chips, left side fender scratches/chips/dents, right rear fender dented/rust, rocker panel dented, left/right rear doors paint peeling, roof dents/chips, tailgate dented/rust/paint chipping, wheel wrench/jack loose under back seat, windshield chips, right mirrors housing broke, left front seat worn, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	327,357 km	\$6,890	3GCUKPEH4FG420111
4,511.95 2-002	Truck 2017 FORD F150 2WD, SuperCab Cab, 8' Box 5.0L, V8, gas auto A/C, tilt, cruise, AM/FM, power heated mirrors, power locks/windows, keyless entry 1 key fob wig wags mounted on grille, has a back seat, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 323,960 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Engine miss fire, both lower ball joints, left inner tie rod, all pads/rotors need replacement, alignment needed, driver door pins, poor battery. KNOWN PROBLEMS: Grille broke, front bumper chips/scratches, rear bumper missing, right rear fender chips/scratches/dents, left side doors door stop missing/paint splatter, right side doors paint splatter, tailgate missing, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield chips, left front seat worn/sagging/foam visible, paint splatter on interior, paint splatter in box/box rails, paint on steering wheel, missing lower part of jump seat, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	323,960 km	\$3,500	1FTEX1CF8HKC38153

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid * 1-009	Truck 2003 FORD F550 RWD, Regular Cab, General Service Body 6.0L, V8, diesel auto A/C, tilt, cruise, 1 key, 5 other keys dual rear wheels, front tow hooks, side steps, trailer tow mirrors, mud flaps, HD rear bumper, trailer wiring, 2" receiver, electric trailer brake, service body-2 beacons and 3 panel sliding top, Cobra max lift crane 3305W 12V, 2 out rigger legs condition unknown, general service body 8 compartments fair condition, white, TOW ONLY, This vehicle has a FAILED SGI Inspection. A TOW ONLY Disclaimer must be signed by the purchaser. This vehicle requires a PASSED SGI Inspection to be licensed. Purchaser assumes full responsibility for repairs and any required inspections. This vehicle is sold in "As is, where is" condition., 402,877 km, KNOWN INSPECTION PROBLEMS: Left manifold broken, engine oil leaks, steady bearing, battery light comes on, dash losing power, intermittent stalling whole driving, rear brake cables, right front mud flap, tires fair. KNOWN PROBLEMS: grille broken, front bumper faded, left and right front fenders chips/road rash/rust, left and right front doors rusted/chips, roof rusted, no first aid kit/fire extinguisher, windshield cracked, minor exterior damage.>, As is, Where is	402,877 km		1FDAF56P63EC72074
			\$6,944	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
REGINA, SaskBuilds and Procurement, SaskSurplus Sales Lot, 500 McLeod Street - Miscellaneous				
Contact SaskSurplus 306-787-2062 or 306-798-3306.				
455.00	2-106	Front Bumper, Iron Cross, heavy duty, steel , Black, with 2 mounting brackets, holes for driving lights/tow hooks, paint poor, significant rust visible, may fit 2500 - 3500 2016 Ram. Fair	\$50	
376.00	* 1-117	Generator, Honda EM2500C , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good	\$375	GC02-6768987
411.00	* 1-129	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good	\$375	GCAE-1960579
600.00	* 1-130	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good	\$375	GCAE-1960582
411.00	* 1-131	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good	\$375	GCAE-2150058
411.00	* 1-133	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good	\$375	GCAE-2442013
411.00	* 1-134	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good	\$375	GCAE-2442021
377.00	* 1-135	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good	\$375	GCAE-2484295
395.00	* 1-136	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good	\$375	GCAE-2484298
456.00	* 1-138	Generator, Honda EM3000C, Cycloconverter , AC out 120V, one 21.7A plug, two 15 A plugs, gas, operational. Good	\$375	GCAE-2484314
No Bid	* 1-142	Riding Lawn Mower, 2004, John Deere 1445 , Front-mount mower 60", 4WD, 31.1 HP, Yanmar 1204cc, diesel, transmission hydrostatic, 400 hours, front tires 23 x 10.50-12 NHS, rear tires 18 x 8.50-10 NHS. Known Problems: Front mount mower hydraulics not operational, rust/scratches/paint peeling, minor exterior damage.> Fair	\$7,500	TC1445D040814
8,105.00	* 1-143	Riding Lawn Mower, 2007, John Deere 1445 , Front-mount mower 60", 4WD, 31.1 HP, Yanmar 1204cc, diesel, transmission hydrostatic, 584 hours, front tires 23 x 10.50-12 NHS, rear tires 18 x 8.50-10 NHS. Known Problems: Rust/scratches/paint peeling, minor exterior damage.> Fair	\$7,500	TC1445D070358
7,500.00	* 1-144	Riding Lawn Mower, 2007, John Deere 1445 , Front-mount mower 60", 4WD, 31.1 HP, Yanmar 1204cc, diesel, transmission hydrostatic, 694 hours, front tires 23 x 10.50-12 NHS, rear tires 18 x 8.50-10 NHS. Known Problems: Right rear tire flat, rust/scratches/paint peeling. minor exterior damage.> Fair	\$7,500	TC1445D070325

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
7,701.00 * 1-141	Riding Lawn Mower, 2004, John Deere 1445 , Front-mount mower 60", 4WD, 31.1 HP, Yanmar 1204cc, diesel, transmission hydrostatic, 740 hours, front tires 23 x 10.50-12 NHS, rear tires 18 x 8.50-10 NHS. Known Problems: Rust/scratches/paint peeling, minor exterior damage.> Fair		\$7,500	TC1445D040810
No Bid * 1-106	Rolling Cargo Bed, 3000 , Attached to 3/4" piece of plywood, with box on top, box, 40"w x 91"d x 13 3/4"h, bed 33"w x 87"d x 2 1/2"h. Fair		\$800	
*WD 2-102	Tailgate, OEM Chevrolet, metal , White, slight scratches with dents, maybe be compatible with 2003-2005 and other years. 1500, 2500, 3500. Good		\$150	
No Bid 2-103	Tailgate, OEM Chevrolet, metal , White, slight scratches with dents, maybe be compatible with 2003-2005 and other years. 1500, 2500, 3500. Good		\$150	
25.00 2-107	Tire, 225/70R19.5, Continental , On steel rim, manufacture date week 08, year 2014, 10" x 9.75" bolt pattern. Fair		\$20	
75.00 2-108	Tire, LT245/70R16, Goodyear Wrangler H4 , On steel rim, manufacture date week 21, year 2002, 8" x 6.5" bolt pattern. Fair		\$20	
75.00 2-109	Tire, LT245/70R17, BF Goodrich Rugged Trail AT , On steel rim, manufacture date week 10, year 2013, 8" x 6.75" bolt pattern. Fair		\$20	
75.00 2-110	Tire, LT245/70R17, BF Goodrich Rugged Trail AT , On steel rim, manufacture date week 13, year 2007, 8" x 6.5" bolt pattern. Fair		\$20	
50.00 2-111	Tire, LT245/70R17, Michelin LTX M/S , On steel rim, manufacture date week 01, year 2012, 8" x 5.5" bolt pattern. Fair		\$20	
66.00 2-112	Tire, LT265/70R17, BF Goodrich Rugged Trail AT , On steel rim, manufacture date week 05, year 2016, 8" x 6.5" bolt pattern. Fair		\$20	
66.00 2-113	Tire, LT265/70R17, Bridgestone Duravis M700HD , On steel rim, manufacture date week 23, year 2015, 8" x 6.75" bolt pattern. Fair		\$20	
121.10 * 1-109	Tires, Set of 4215/60R16, Sumitomo Ice Edge, M+S, SF , Manufacture date. Week 17, year 2019. Fair		\$120	
185.00 2-104	Tires, Set of 4225/60R16, Sumitomo HTR Enhance, M+S , Manufacture date. Week 29, year 2017. Good		\$160	
155.00 * 12-104	Tires, Set of 4225/65R/17, Sumitomo Encounter HT, M+S , Manufacture date. Week 35, year 2018. Fair		\$120	
250.01 2-105	Tires, Set of 4265/60R17, Goodyear Eagle Enforcer Winter, Snow Flake , Manufacture date. Week 45, year 2021. Fair		\$250	
872.00 2-114	Trailer, Cable Reel, 1978, metal , Pintle hitch 2.5", 6 pole plug heavy duty die cast connector, GVW unknown, tire size P205/75R14, 164"w x 52.5"d, no spare, back gate ramp. Poor		\$100	SASK90578003140
1,081.08 2-115	Trailer, Cable Reel, 1986 Mallard, metal , Pintle hitch 2.5", GVW 2590 lb/1175 kg, tire size 7.00-15, 128"w x 61.5"d, no spare tire. Poor		\$100	2D94R8DFXG1010865

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
720.72 2-116	Trailer, Cable Reel, 1990 Wy-Lee, metal , Pintle hitch 2.5", 6 pole plug heavy duty die cast connector, GVW 2500 lb /1134 kg, tire size 7.00-15LT, 128"w x 61.5"w, spare tire, lights non operational. Poor		\$100	2W9ME10B9L1005025
1,081.08 2-117	Trailer, Cable Reel, 2000 Trailtech, metal , Pintle hitch 3", 6 pole plug heavy duty die cast connector, GVW unknown, tire size ST205/75R14, 122"w x 6"d, has a spare tire. Poor		\$100	2CU1FG914Y2006112
1,081.08 2-118	Trailer, Cable Reel, 2003 Majestik, metal , Pintle hitch 3", GVW unknown, tire size ST225/75R14, 129"w x 61.5"d, trailer brakes, spare tire side wall destroyed. Poor		\$100	2M9US11503R151780
720.72 2-119	Trailer, Cable Reel, 2004 Arnold, metal , Pintle hitch 2.5", 6 pole plug heavy duty die cast connector, GVW 3000 lb/1360 kg, tire size ST225/75R14, 126"w x 61.5"d, spare tire. Poor		\$100	2A9DS11374R16001
720.72 2-120	Trailer, Cable Reel, 2005 Arnold, metal , Pintle hitch 2.5", GVW 3000 lb/1360 kg, tire size ST225/75R15, 122"w x 61.5"d, has a spare tire. Fair		\$500	2A9DS11385R160011
1,081.08 2-121	Trailer, Cable Reel, 2011 Saturn, metal , Pintle hitch 2.5", GVW 2900 lb/1315 kg, tire size ST225/75R15, 149"w x 61"d, has a spare tire. Good		\$1,000	2S915B214BW010118
1,081.08 2-122	Trailer, Cable Reel, 2021 Trailtech, metal , Pintle hitch 3", 6 pole plug heavy duty die cast connector, GVW 2998 lb/1360 kg, tire size ST225/75R15, 131"w x 61.5"d, no spare tire, right rear tail light non operational. Good		\$1,000	2CUGFB911M2040614
676.00 2-123	Trailer, Utility, 1978, metal frame, wood floor , 4'w x 10'd, pintle hitch 2.5", 6 pole plug heavy duty die cast connector, GVW unknown, tire size 1555/75R14, no spare, back gate ramp. Poor		\$100	SASK90578003139
No Bid * 1-103	Desk, Steelcase , Disassembled, main 63"w x 30"d x 30"h, L-side unknown 44"w 24"d x 30"h, desk comes with two drawers no keys, modesty panels, surface tops and gables comes with instruction booklet, scratches (wear and tear). Fair		\$20	
No Bid * 1-105	Desk, Steelcase , Disassembled, main 63"w x 30"d x 30"h, L-side unknown 44"w 24"d x 30"h, desk comes with two drawers no keys, modesty panels, surface tops and gables comes with instruction booklet, scratches (wear and tear). Fair		\$20	
18.88 * 9-143	Printer, Large Desktop, Hewlett-Packard LaserJet 9050DN , Operational (powers on, no noises, no further testing, AS IS), some scratches, wiped/reset, power cord included. Fair		\$1	JPRCC5Q04M
KINDERSLEY, Agriculture, Regional Services, 1120 - 608 12th Ave E.				
Contact Harpreet Kaur 306-463-5513, Harpreet.kaur2@gov.sk.ca or Laine Radwell 306-430-8405, laine.radwell@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid * 12-512	Chair, Fabric, metal , Black, no wheels & arms. Good		\$1	
No Bid * 12-513	Chair, Fabric, metal , Red/black/silver, no wheels, with arms. Good		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
KINDERSLEY, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, Provincial Protective Services, 113 2nd Ave E				
Contact Ted Glass 306-460-4291, Ted.Glass@gov.sk.ca or Cory Loitz 306-867-5563, Cory.Loitz@gov.sk.ca				
15.51	2-504	Binoculars, Tasco ZIP 2001 , 7 x 35 mm, wide angle, focus & knob works, no eyecups. Fair	\$5	
No Bid	2-536	Bird Aviary, Wood/Wire Mesh , 94" w x 46.5" d x 76" h, 3 separate holding areas - 1 (90" w x 38" h) and 2 (45" w x 25" h), sloped asphalt shingled roof. Good	\$1	
26.00	2-505	Bird Decoys, Assorted , 2 floating ducks, 6 clamshell geese, 1 wooden homemade. Fair	\$25	
18.00	2-506	Block and Tackle, , Nylon rope, 1000 lbs rated, 70" long max extension. Good	\$10	
26.00	2-507	Boat Fuel Tank, Scepter , 20 L, hose connector, vented caps. Good	\$25	
101.25	2-508	Camera, Canon AE-1program , 35 mm SLR, includes 50 mm lens, 70-210 mm lens, 277T flash, 2 rolls film, instruction books, soft carry case, no memory card/no internal memory, unknown if operational. Good	\$25	
No Bid	2-509	Camera, Olympus Stylus Tough , Includes carry case, battery, charger, no memory card/no internal memory, operational. Good	\$25	G79622057
6.00	2-510	Camera, RCA pro8 , 8 mm, 12X zoom, includes 5 new tapes, used battery, charger, remote, carrying bag, no memory card/no internal memory, operational. Fair	\$5	44,060,561
26.00	2-511	Chain Hoist, Jet L-90 , 1/2 Ton, 9' max extension. Good	\$10	
No Bid	2-512	Come-along Tool, , 8' single & 4' doubled length, damaged & missing parts. Broken Repairable	\$5	
100.00	2-513	Electronic Caller, Johnny Stewart , Includes cassettes of animal calls, VHS instructional video, remote speaker, batteries, charger, bag, operational. Fair	\$10	
6.00	2-537	File Cabinet, Lot of 2Metal, 3 drawer, lateral , Beige, with 2 keys, 36" w x 18" d x 39.5" h, with hanging folder rails. Good	\$1	
6.00	2-538	File Cabinet, Metal, 4 drawer, vertical , Silver/grey, 18" w x 28" d x 51" h, with reinforced locking bar, padlock not included. Good	\$1	
12.00	2-515	Fireproof Safe, Sentry 1100 , 15 "w x 10" d x 6" h (outer dimension), 12" w x 7" d x 3.5" h (inner dimension), 3 keys, drilled for mounting, grey. Fair	\$5	S856167
12.00	2-514	Fireproof Safe, Sentry 1100 , 15" w x 10" d x 6" h (outer dimension), 12" w x 7" d x 3.5" h (inner dimension), 2 keys, drilled for mounting, grey. Fair	\$5	V463798
No Bid	2-516	Flashlight, Streamlight Stinger XT , Includes 120 V charger and 12 V Charger, lights operational, needs new rechargeable battery. Good	\$25	280,624
No Bid	2-517	Foot Rest, Metal , Angled. Good	\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
6.00 2-518	Gas Mask, MSA MD , 3 N95 filters, shield clouded. Poor		\$5	
No Bid 2-519	Helmets, Lot of 2 , One Polaris size- XL, black & one North- size medium, blue. Poor		\$5	
26.00 2-520	Hydrogen Sulfide (H2S) Detector, MSA Mini H2S Responder , Includes manual, 9v, screen lights up, unknown if operational. Poor		\$5	
No Bid 2-521	Literature Rack, Montel , 36" w x 46" h, 8 tier. Good		\$5	
No Bid 2-522	Multi-Tools, Stainless Steel , 1.5" w x 4" h (closed), 6.25" h (opened), includes screwdriver, knife, pliers, wood saw, can/bottle opener, comes with a case. Fair		\$5	
No Bid 2-523	Personal Flotation Device, Keep-A-Float universal , Adult, red key hole. Good		\$5	
17.00 2-524	Postage Scale, Pelouze Zephyr LC2 , 4" w x 4" d x 6" h, spring /dial work. Good		\$5	
No Bid 2-525	Punch, , 4 hole for legal size paper. Good		\$5	
No Bid 2-526	Reptile Habitat, Glass Terrarium , 30" w x 12" d x 13" h, with heat lamp, water bowl, artificial foliage, thermometer, log, screen cover. Fair		\$25	
66.00 2-527	Snow Fence, , 100' w x 4' h per roll estimate, orange, 2 opened & 2 unopened. Good		\$25	
6.31 2-539	Snowmobile Helmet, HJC CS-R1E , Black, size XL, heated clear shield (no cord), includes amber shield attachment and a cloth carry bag. Good		\$1	
11.31 2-528	Space Heater, Duracraft , 12" w x 5" d x 8.5" h, 120 VAC, operational. Good		\$5	E123467
58.00 2-529	Spotting Scope, Bushnell Spacemaster , 15-40X zoom, 60 mm, rubber armour, lens dirty, focus/magnification knobs operational. Fair		\$15	
No Bid 2-530	Truck Tool Box, Challenger , 5' long, includes key and plastic tray. Good		\$50	
186.00 2-531	Winch, Warrior , 4500 lbs, 2" mounted, 12VDC connector, includes wired remote, 50' long cable with hook, operational. Good		\$25	RW12617
22.00 2-532	Wire Rolls, Lot of 3 , Smooth heavy, unopened, approx 170' long, 10 lbs. Good		\$5	
OUTLOOK, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, 420 Saskatchewan Ave				
Contact Scott Andrew 306-420-6427, scott.andrew@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid * 12-536	Reciprocating Saw, DeWalt DC385 18V , Includes case, battery charger, battery; battery does not take charge, unknown if operational. Poor		\$1	264,702

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
PIKE LAKE PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks, Culture & Sport, Call for directions, at the end of highway 60 south.				
Contact Dwight Martin 306-933-6968, dwight.martin@gov.sk.ca				
3,888.89	2-567	Tractor 1957 International Wheatland Special 2WD 2.9L, inline 4, gas manual Differential type open, 40 hp, single tire, front tire ply 7.5-16 rear tire ply 14.9-28 tractor was used as a Zamboni (ice resurface) power unit, has homemade 3-point hitch mount, tires are studded for ice, , red, , 3,166 hours, KNOWN PROBLEMS: Has not run in 2 seasons, unknown if fully operational, would not start last time it was attempted, motor/transmission/brakes/battery/lights, body has been repainted/rust showing through, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is	3,166 hours	7,187
			\$750	
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Ave				
Contact Alan Carswell 306-953-2423, alan.carswell@gov.sk.ca or Tammy McGunigal 306-953-2422, tammy.mcgunigal@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid *	1-503	Air Purifier, Honeywell Power Alimentation , Operational, unknown if cleans air. Fair		
			\$1	
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Avenue North				
Contact Brent Zbaraschuk 306-953-2428, brent.zbaraschuk@gov.sk.ca or Bob Northey 306-930-8719, bob.northey@gov.sk.ca				
1,425.00	2-533	Tractor Approx 1983 - 1986 John Deere 401D 2WD 421 DT 11, 4 cylinders, diesel manual with shuttle shift Cab heater, 8 speed, rear axle single, locking differential, single tire, tire size 19.5R24, 11L.15SL, tire ply 4 (rear) weights, yellow, , 3,390 hrs., KNOWN PROBLEMS: Will not move due to transmission problem, tires fair, poor paint/body exterior/interior/lights/mirrors/horn, poor battery, minor exterior damage.> As is, Where is	3,390 hrs.	620645T
			\$250	
78.99	2-568	Tents , Lot of 5Fireline, polyethylene , Orange, 12'w x 14'd x 8'h, in a yellow bag. Fair		
			\$1	
66.66	2-569	Tents , Lot of 5Fireline, polyethylene , Orange, 12'w x 14'd x 8'h, in a yellow bag. Fair		
			\$1	
78.99	2-570	Tents , Lot of 5Fireline, polyethylene , Orange, 12'w x 14'd x 8'h, in a yellow bag. Fair		
			\$1	
55.55	2-571	Tents , Lot of 4Fireline, polyethylene , Orange, 12' x 14', in a yellow bag. Fair		
			\$1	
127.00	2-572	Tents , Lot of 5Fireline, polyethylene , Orange, 12'w x 14'd x 8'h, in a yellow bag. Fair		
			\$1	
55.55	2-573	Tents , Lot of 4Fireline, polyethylene , Orange, 12'w x 14'd x 8'h, without yellow bag. Fair		
			\$1	
117.00	2-574	Tents , Lot of 5Fireline, polyethylene , Orange, 12'w x 14'd x 8'h, in a yellow bag. Fair		
			\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
127.00 2-575	Tents , Lot of 5 Fireline, polyethylene , Orange, 12'w x 14'd x 8'h, without yellow bag. Fair		\$1	
2,000.00 2-576	Welder , Miller, Millermatic 252, MIG , 230/460/575V, blue/black, with cart, operational. Fair		\$100	MA 180076N
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Ave N				
Contact Bob Northey 306-930-8719, bob.northey@gov.sk.ca or Brent Zbaraschuk 306-953-2428, brent.zbaraschuk@gov.sk.ca				
18,567.77 2-577	Military Percheron 1989 STEYR H809 Cargo, 6WD 6 cylinder, diesel manual Winch, crane, axillary engine heater Flat deck with sides, 1150 gal. poly water tank, Waterax 23 Vanguard B2X pump, 1" fire hose and reel, 8 speed, 6x6 axle with lock up, single tire, tire size, 14R20, 22 ply, with spare tire, green, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. ALL DECALING WILL BE REMOVED BEFORE THIS VEHICLE IS RELEASED TO THE CUSTOMER As is, where is, no inspection supplied, may not be SGI registerable. Emergency lights and sirens will be removed by the seller if the highest bidder isn't a certified emergency organization, in doing that it would render these vehicles as "FOR PARTS ONLY or SCRAP ONLY", bidders of these units may need to provide proof that they are an Emergency Organization Parts for repair may not be available - TOW-ONLY, 43,482 km, KNOWN PROBLEMS: Right side	43,482 km	\$12,500	2UTIC10C2KK030086
21,005.00 2-578	Military Percheron 1989 STEYR H809 Cargo, 6WD 6 cylinder, diesel manual Winch, crane Flat deck with sides, approx. 1000 gal. poly water tank, Maximum Hale pump, Hannay Reel, 1" hose, 8 speed, 6x6 axle with lock up, single tire, tire size, 14R20, 22 ply, with spare tire, green, TOW ONLY, NO SGI Inspection. It is unknown if any repairs or safety concerns exist (if any). Requires a passed SGI Inspection to be licensed. Buyer assumes full responsibility for repairs if required. ALL DECALING WILL BE REMOVED BEFORE THIS VEHICLE IS RELEASED TO THE CUSTOMER As is, where is, no inspection supplied, may not be SGI registerable. Emergency lights and sirens will be removed by the seller if the highest bidder isn't a certified emergency organization, in doing that it would render these vehicles as "FOR PARTS ONLY or SCRAP ONLY", bidders of these units may need to provide proof that they are an Emergency Organization Parts for repair may not be available - TOW-ONLY, 53,218 km, KNOWN PROBLEMS: Right	53,218 km	\$12,500	C10C3KK03024

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
REGINA, Agriculture, 1610 Park St				
Contact James Bush 306-798-0100, james.bush@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid * 1-502	Autopipetting Robot, Tecan Computer Controlled Liquid Handling Robot , 42" x 41" x 44". This needs software to function, and software is on a flash drive that is included. There is no training manual, but usually Tecan would come out and train users on it. There is no risk to sell to public. Operational. Good		\$45,000	
REGINA, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, 7900 Ritter Ave				
Contact Dan Elberg office 306-787-3562 cell 306-533-9524, dan.elberg@gov.sk.ca				
550.00 2-534	Drum Sander, General International, rc184596 , 16", 1.5 hp 220 v, class E, variable speed & open-ended, operational. Good		\$100	
2,557.00 2-535	Metal Lathe , King Canada, CT-1440B , 14" x 40" Gearhead, 1.5 hp 220 v Class E, operational. Good		\$75	
REGINA, Labour Relations and Workplace Safety, 300-1870 Albert St S4P 4W1				
Contact Brandon Darmochid 306-527-1709, brandon.darmochid@gov.sk.ca or Ryan Bosgoed 306-787-7190, ryan.bosgoed@gov.sk.ca				
8.19 2-595	Chair, , 5 castor, black leather, dual arm. Fair		\$1	
20.00 2-596	Chair, , 5 castor, black leather, dual arm, adjustable, white stitching. Fair		\$1	
2.25 2-597	Mobile Pedestal, , 3 drawer, missing one castor, no lock or key, pepper dust color. Fair		\$1	
REGINA, Sask Builds and Procurement, OSD/Construction Services, 2430 7th Ave				
Contact Gordon Hamilton 306-536-2181, gordon.hamilton5@gov.sk.ca or Joey Novak 306-533-6347, joey.novak@gov.sk.ca				
675.88 2-503	CNC Carving Machine, General International, 40-915 M1 , 30"w x 39"d x 32"h, operational, some superficial damage to deck, design software not included. Fair		\$1	40,500,911
REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority, 1702 Park St				
Contact Kristen Nelson 306-787-0179, knelson@slga.com or Tyrone Smith 306-787-1934, tsmith1@slga.com				
5.00 * 12-539	Chairs, Lot of 2Fabric, wooden frame , Aqua, with armrests and legs. Fair		\$5	
5.00 * 12-540	Chairs, Lot of 2Fabric, wooden frame , Blue, with armrests and legs. Good		\$5	
5.00 * 12-542	Chairs, Lot of 3Fabric, wooden frame , Green, with armrests and legs. Good		\$5	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
REGINA, Saskatchewan Liquor and Gaming Authority, 1702 Park St				
Contact Kristen Nelson 306-787-0179, knelson@slga.com or Sherrie Sawin 306-787-3097, ssawin@slga.com				
No Bid 2-540	Desk, Laminate, metal, rectangular , 36" w x 24" d x 28" h. Good		\$5	
5.25 2-541	File Cabinet, Cole, metal, 4 drawer, lateral , Beige, no key, 36" w x 18" d x 51.5" h. Fair		\$5	
5.25 2-542	File Cabinet, Global, metal, 3 drawer, lateral , Beige, no key, 36" w x 18" d x 40.5" h. Good		\$5	
No Bid 2-543	File Cabinet, Global, metal, 3 shelves & 2 drawers, lateral , Beige, no key, 36" w x 18" d x 35.25" h, adjustable shelves, no doors for the top 3 shelves. Fair		\$5	
15.25 2-544	File Cabinet, Global, Metal, 4 drawer, lateral , Beige, with key, 36" w x 18" d x 54" h, 3 sliding panel and 1 drawer, 3rd sliding panel catching but still opens. Broken Repairable		\$5	
5.25 2-545	File Cabinet, HON, metal, 2 drawer, lateral , Beige, no key, 36" w x 19.25" d x 28" h, top part has scratches/scuffed. Fair		\$5	
5.25 2-546	File Cabinet, HON, metal, 3 drawer, lateral , Beige, no key, 36" w x 19.25" d x 41" h. Good		\$5	
5.25 2-547	File Cabinet, HON, metal, 4 drawer, lateral , Beige, no key, 36" w x 19.25" d x 53.25" h. Fair		\$5	
5.25 2-548	File Cabinet, HON, metal, 4 drawer, lateral , Beige, no key, 36" w x 19.25" d x 53.25" h. Fair		\$5	
5.25 2-549	File Cabinet, HON, metal, 4 drawer, lateral , Beige, no key, 36" w x 19.25" d x 53.25" h. Fair		\$5	
5.25 2-550	File Cabinet, HON, metal, 4 drawer, lateral , Beige, no key, 36" w x 19.25" d x 53.5" h. Fair		\$5	
15.75 2-551	File Cabinet, HON, metal, 4 drawer, lateral , Beige, no key, 36" w x 19.25" d x 66.5" h, 1 sliding panel. Fair		\$5	
15.25 2-552	File Cabinet, HON, metal, 4 drawer, lateral , Beige, with key, 36" w x 19.25" d x 53.25" h. Good		\$5	
5.25 2-553	File Cabinet, Metal, 3 drawer, lateral , Beige, no key, 36" w x 18" d x 39.5" h. Good		\$5	
15.25 2-554	File Cabinet, Metal, 3 drawer, vertical , Beige, with key, 15" w x 23" d x 27.5" h. Good		\$5	
15.25 2-555	File Cabinet, Metal, 3 drawer, vertical , Beige, with key, 15" w x 23" d x 27.5" h. Fair		\$5	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
5.25 2-556	File Cabinet, Metal, 4 drawer, lateral , Beige, no key, 36" w x 18" d x 51.5" h. Fair		\$5	
15.25 2-557	File Cabinet, Metal, 4 drawer, lateral , Beige, with key, 36" w x 18" d x 51.5" h. Good		\$5	
15.25 2-558	File Cabinet, Metal, 4 drawer, lateral , Beige, with key, 36" w x 18" d x 51.5" h. Good		\$5	
No Bid 2-559	File Cabinet, Lot of 2Sankey Shelden, Metal, 4 drawer, vertical , Grey, no keys, 28" w x 18" d x 51" h. Fair		\$5	
No Bid 2-560	Hutch, Solid wooden , 36" w x 19.75" d x 65 "h, top 2 door vertical, bottom 2 drawer lateral, no key. Good		\$15	
5.00 2-561	Shelf, HON, metal, vertical , Black, 34.5" w x 12.5" d x 71" h, adjustable 5 shelves. Good		\$5	
5.63 2-562	Shelf/Cart, Wooden , 27.25" w x 24" d x 32" h, 2 tier- 1 sliding, 4 swivel casters. Fair		\$5	
12.50 2-563	Shelving Unit, Pressboard, lateral , Grey, 6 shelves, 36" w x 12" d x 72" h. Fair		\$5	
21.00 2-564	Storage Cabinet, Pressboard , Beige, no lock, 35.5" w x 18.25" d x 38.5"h, 2 door, adjustable 3 shelves. Fair		\$5	
No Bid 2-565	Storage cabinet, Pressboard , White, with door, 2 shelves, 19.5" w x 15.5"d x 27.5" h, 4 swivel casters. Good		\$5	
No Bid 2-566	Table, Wooden, rectangular , 54" w x 24" d x 30" h. Fair		\$5	
SASKATOON, Corrections, Policing and Public Safety, SCC, 910 60th St. E				
Contact Renee Pound 306-956-8817, renee.pound@gov.sk.ca or Danielle Corriveau 306-956-8869 danielle.corriveau@gov.sk.ca.				
15.51 2-579	Bread Pans, Lot of 10metal , 1 four-compartment , 1 three-compartment and 3 single. Good		\$1	
21.12 2-580	Colanders & Bowls, Lot of 18aluminum , 4 colanders, 1 small pot, 4 mixing bowls, 3 soup pots and 6 plastic 2 litre juice containers. Good		\$1	
10.25 2-581	Cutlery, Lot of 20metal , Assorted tongs, ice cream scoops and serving spoons. Good		\$1	
155.00 2-582	Foam Mats, Lot of 14foam , Each 47 3/4" w x 23 3/4" d x 1 1/2" h. Good		\$1	
3.45 2-583	Food Tray, Lot of 35steel , Each 15 1/4" w x 12 1/2" d. Good		\$1	
1,899.99 2-584	Globe Mixer, Model SP30, cast iron , 30 Qt gear driven, MD 012 15, HP: 1, Volts: 115, Phase: 1, Amps: 16, HZ:60, 28.50" w x 28.50" d x 57.5" h, operational. Good		\$1	73 18079
No Bid * 9-565	Keyboard Tray, metal , 20"w x 11"d, black, pull out style. Fair		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
No Bid * 9-566	Keyboard Tray, metal , 27"w x 10 1/2"d, mounting arm 21 1/2" length, pull out style. Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 1-512	Locker, Metal , 1 grey single - 12"w x 17 5/8"d x 72"h, locks not included. Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 1-511	Locker, Metal , 1 red double - 24"w x 19 1/2"d x 72"h; 1 red single - two doors, 12"w x 18"d x 72"h and 1 red single locker 12"w x 19 1/2"d x 72"h, locks not included. Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 1-514	Locker, Metal , 36"w x 21"d x 72"h, blue, 1 tier, 3 door, locks not included. Fair		\$1	
26.20 2-585	Muffin Tins, Lot of 16metal , 24 muffins per tray, 20 3/4" w x 14" d. Good		\$1	
23.45 2-586	Pans and Cutlery, Lot of 13aluminum , 4 bunt pans, 1 colander, wooden rolling pins, ladles, deep fryer scoops, 5 napkin holders and 3 cutlery containers. Good		\$1	
5.02 2-587	Pans and Holders, Lot of 18aluminum , 8 napkin holders, 1 hot water container and 9 trays, 12 3/4" w x 6 5/8" d varying heights. Good		\$1	
65.75 2-588	Pots, Lot of 8aluminum , 1 large 18 1/2" d pot, 6 smaller pots and 1 colander. Good		\$1	
18.00 2-589	Roaster pans, Lot of 8aluminum , Approx. 21 1/2" w x 19" d x 3" h. Good		\$1	
16.79 2-590	Serving Trays, Lot of 12aluminum , 7 Aluminum Serving trays, and 5 tin foil . Good		\$1	
No Bid * 1-515	Storage Container, Plastic , 29 1/2"w x 13"d x 28 1/2"h, white, on casters. Fair		\$1	
No Bid * 9-571	Telephone Accessories, Approx Lot of 10plastic , Black/white/grey, assorted plug ins, telephone and handset cords. Fair		\$1	
21.75 2-591	Tomato Slicer, Vollrath, 06445GNmetal , Does not have blades. Good		\$1	
101.00 2-592	Transport Bag, Meret pro transport systemfabric , 3 roller wheels, 16" w x 12.25 d x 29.25" h. Good		\$1	
275.00 2-593	Transport Bags, Lot of 4Ferno Trauma/Air Management Bagfabric , Oxygen carry bag - one 23" w x 13" d x 10" h and One - 24" w x 9" d x 3" h. Good		\$1	
No Bid 2-594	Trivets, Lot of 10aluminum , 16 3/4" w x 8 3/4" d. Good		\$1	
No Bid * 9-572	Universal Modular Amplifier, Plantronics Vista, M12 , Black, unknown if operational. Fair		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
SASKATOON, Ministry of Environment , Ministry of highways Maintance Shop 126-105th St.				
Contact Gord Sedgewick 306-229-4230, gord.sedgewick@gov.sk.ca				
1,111.00	2-501	Boat, Lund, Rhino Tuff, 1977, aluminum , Rivets may need to be replaced, 16', trailer not included. Good	\$1	241,508
362.00	2-502	Boat Trailer, 1997, EasyLoader , Maximum boat length 14'; trailer needs complete maintenance, single axle, winch not included. Broken Repairable	\$1	1ZEAAFJA8VA024153
PIKE LAKE PROVINCIAL PARK, Parks, Culture & Sport, Call for directions, at the end of highway 60 south.				
Contact Dwight Martin 306-933-6968, dwight.martin@gov.sk.ca or Scott Cross 306-229-2350, scott.cross@gov.sk.ca				
8.00	2-598	Air Systems, 2009, MULTI-PAK , 2 Cylinder, Air Cart 4500 PSI, 4 outlet MP-4H, tanks are fiberglass, not maintained or inspected since 2014, unknown if operational. Fair	\$1	48,992
178.00	2-599	Boat, Fisher, aluminum , Flat Bottom, 14' length, 31" w floor, 43" w gunnal, has patches, dents and leaks. Poor	\$1	
100.01	2-600	Chainsaw, Husqvarna 345 , Carb need to be replaced, throttle is broken, non-operational, needs to be repaired. Broken Repairable	\$1	
222.22	2-601	Cultivator, Ford, I0284 , 7' length, 3 point hitch mount, appears to be all in tact. Fair	\$100	1068
239.82	2-602	Lawn Sweeper, Rogers/Jacobsen, 720E , Pickup width 48", adjustable dethatcher bar, tow behind, no engine, flat tires, non-operational - a motor needs to be installed, trailer required for transportation, air needs to be put in tires to roll onto trailer. Broken Repairable	\$1	10,008
511.00	2-603	Tandem Disc, Unknown manufacturer, Model 201 , Appears to be all in tact, unknown if operational. Fair	\$100	2533-11
PRINCE ALBERT, Saskatchewan Public Safety Agency, 2120 Central Ave N				
Contact Brent Zbaraschuk 306-953-2428, brent.zbaraschuk@gov.sk.ca or Bob Northey 306-930-8719, bob.northey@gov.sk.ca				
No Bid	2-604	Electric Motor, Leeson, VP , 460 volts, 29/10 amps, 25/6.3 H.P, was operational when put away. Good	\$500	
No Bid	2-605	Fire Extinguishing Agent, Lot of 12 Mono Ammonium Phosphate , Dry chemical powder, pails of fire extinguishing agent. Poor	\$1	
No Bid	2-606	Fire Extinguishing Agent, Lot of 24 Potassium Chloride , Dry chemical powder, pails of fire extinguishing agent. Poor	\$1	
27.73	2-607	Hard Hats, Lot of 14 , 12 boxes of white, 2 boxes of yellow (24 Per box). New- Unused	\$10	
37.00	2-608	Hoses, Lot of 17 Suction , Various lengths. Fair	\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
140.25 2-609	Hoses, Lot of Approx 14Suction , Various sizes 2"/3"/4", various lengths, some with couplings and others bare. Poor		\$1	
101.00 2-610	Lights, Lot of 12Quartz, halogen , Telescopic, operational. New- Unused		\$100	
75.99 2-611	Lights, Lot of Approx 12Quartz, halogen , Telescopic, operational. Good		\$75	
50.99 2-612	Spotlight, Lot of 3Power Fist, 3 Million Candle Power , 6v, 25w bulb, rechargeable battery, adjustable stand, back warning light, includes AC/DC Cul adapter, 12v DC car charger. New- Unused		\$50	
27.50 2-613	Tailgate, Chevrolet, Silverado , White. Good		\$1	
60.00 2-614	Tailgate, Ford, F-150 , White. Good		\$1	
60.00 2-615	Tailgate, Ford, F-150 , White. Good		\$1	
111.11 2-616	Tailgate, GMC , Red. Good		\$1	
30.00 2-617	Tire, 11R22.5, BF Goodrich DR444 , Steering, on rim. Poor		\$1	
25.66 2-618	Tire, 65R25, Goodyear , On rim. Poor		\$1	
201.00 2-619	Tires, Set of 410-16.5, Goodyear (2), Titan (2) , For skid steer. Fair		\$1	
30.00 2-620	Tires, Set of 211R22.5, Bridgestone M725 (1), Michelin Xline (1) , On rims. Poor		\$1	
45.00 2-621	Tires, Set of 211R22.5, Firestone FT455 , Steering, on rims. Poor		\$1	
157.00 2-622	Tires, Set of 211R22.5, Michelin X , On rims. Fair		\$1	
30.00 2-623	Tires, Set of 211R22.5, Michelin XDN2 , On rims. Poor		\$1	
40.00 2-624	Tires, Set of 213.0 x 5.0 , 4 ply, with axle, on rims. Poor		\$1	
36.00 2-625	Tires, Set of 4205/75R15, Trail America , 3 with rims, 1 without rim. Beyond Repair		\$1	
61.25 2-626	Tires, Set of 4205/75R15, Trail America ST , On rims. Poor		\$1	
2.33 2-627	Tires, Set of 3225/70R19.5, Hankook DH01 (2), Continental (1) , Fair		\$1	
12.00 2-628	Tires, Set of 4235/65R18, Nokian Nordman SUV , Fair		\$1	
79.97 2-629	Tires, Set of 3235/80R16, Triangle Radial S/T , 2 with rims, 1 without rim, 8 bolt pattern. Beyond Repair		\$1	
3.33 2-630	Tires, Set of 3245/75R17, BF Goodrich All-Terrain T/A , Fair		\$1	
2.00 2-631	Tires, Set of 3245/75R17, Firestone destination X/T , Fair		\$1	
200.00 2-632	Tires, Set of 224R21, Michelin X , On rims. Fair		\$1	
No Bid 2-633	Tires, Set of 224R21, Michelin X , Poor		\$1	

Item #	Description	Kms	Min Price	Serial Number
11.32 2-634	Tires, Set of 224R21, Michelin X , Poor		\$1	
55.00 2-635	Tires, Set of 224R21, Michelin XZL , Poor		\$1	
157.00 2-636	Tires, Set of 2275/70R22.5, Goodyear G104 RST , Fair		\$1	
150.00 2-637	Tires, Set of 2395/85R20, Michelin X , On rims. Poor		\$1	
25.00 2-638	Tires, Set of 28 x 14.5, Kumho (1), Goodyear (1) , On rims. Poor		\$1	
51.73 2-639	Tires, Set of 38.75R16, Bridgestone R273 SWP, Firestone Wide track Radial Baja , On rims.		\$1	
51.73 2-640	Tires, Set of 38.75R16, Firestone Steelex radial R4S (2), Baja (2) , On rims. Poor		\$1	
111.11 2-641	Tires, Set of 4LT315/70R17, Cooper Discover , Poor		\$1	
111.11 2-642	Tires, Set of 4LT315/70R17, Kumho Road Venture A/T (3), Cooper discover (1) , On rims. Poor		\$1	
11.88 2-643	Tires , Set of 3385/65R22.5, Goodyear G296 MSA(2) BF Goodrich (1) , Poor		\$1	
2.00 2-644	Tires , Set of 29.00R20, (Dayton Rim) Firestone Transport (1) Goodyear (1) , On rim. Poor		\$1	
100.00 2-645	Water Pump, Power fist , 6.5 HP, with CE P80C 3" pump, operational. Poor		\$1	